

			Westcott Group (Eastern) \$0 delivery, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Staples, \$35.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Regional Distributors, \$150 minimum order, Tuesday delivery, sales rep assigned		Veritiv (Xpedx), \$250 minimum order, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Dobmeier, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery Wednesday, sales rep assigned		Corr, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery unknown, sales rep assigned		Grainger, \$? Minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Pyramid, \$25 minimum order, delivery M-5, sales rep assigned		Ecolab, \$1 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Palmer, \$1 minimum order, delivery T,Th,S, sales rep assigned		Buffalo, \$150 minimum order, delivery Friday, sales rep assigned		All American, \$500.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Central Poly, \$0.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Dash, 1 cs minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned				
ITEM DESCRIPTION	CASE SIZE	ANNUAL USAGE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE			
<b>items may be ordered by one or more departments.</b>																																	
Air Freshener, fan cartridge style, Citrus or Cherry	6/cs	22	\$35.10	6							\$33.00	12/CS	\$46.54		\$ 35.50	6	\$29.95	6/CS							\$26.10	12/CASE							
Bags, Grocery AJM 25#	100/bundle	2	\$18.40	BDL-500			\$21.12	500/pack			NB				\$ 26.25	Package of 500	NO BID								\$17.01	500/bundle							
Bags, Sandwich, fold-over (2000)	2000/box	4	\$12.09	2000			\$9.27	2000/box			NB				\$ 12.65	Package of 2,000	NO BID								\$6.00	2000/case							
Bleach	4/1gal	29	\$7.98	6	\$10.99	3	\$8.98	6/1gal	\$10.73	1 gal / - 6/ctn	\$8.55	6/1 GAL			\$ 5.11	Package of 3	NO BID								\$8.77	6/gal/case							
Bowl, foam, 12 oz	1000/cs	43	\$15.37	1000	\$28.89	1000	\$13.24	1000/cs	\$15.87	10-12 oz / 1000/ctn	\$15.62	1000			\$ 57.64	Package of 1,000	NO BID									1000/case							
Bowl, foam, 4-5 oz	1000/cs	10	\$14.20	1000	\$37.29	1000	\$13.35	1000/cs			\$11.30	1000			\$ 26.83	Package of 1,000	NO BID									1000/case							
Broom, large angle	12/cs	12	\$6.98	EA	\$76.44	1	\$93.24	12/cs	\$67.33	12/ctn	\$6.10	EACH			\$ 11.69	Each	\$3.79	12 EA/CS							\$31.08	6/case							
Cleaner, Degreaser, Aerosol 20 oz. cans	12/cs	4	\$18.99	12/20 OZ	\$26.18	32	\$34.05	12/20oz	\$27.54	19oz - 12/ctn	\$23.60	12/19 OZ	\$20.33		\$ 12.75	Each	\$26.89	12 CANS/CS															
Cleaner, Disinfectant, Aerosol foaming, 20 oz.	12/cs	7	\$19.06	12/20 OZ	\$25.75	12	\$26.85	12/18oz	\$26.66	19oz - 12/ctn	\$24.58	12/19 OZ	\$20.77		\$ 1.90	Each	\$25.85	12 CANS/CS															
Cleaner, Drain, Industrial (Simoniz)	12/cs	4	\$22.50	12-quarts	\$65.59	12	\$66.00	12/32oz			\$40.50	12/1 QTS	\$29.29		\$91.83	Each	NO BID																
Cleaner, Glass, 20 oz. spray cans (One Swipe)	12/case	3	\$19.06	12/20 OZ	\$20.00	12	\$25.65	12/20oz			\$18.00	12/19 OZ	\$20.77		\$3.44	Each	\$24.99	12 CANS/CS								\$20.16	12/20oz						
Cleaner, Oven and Grill	12/cs	3	\$22.93	4X1	\$45.29	12	\$32.55	12/18oz	\$34.77	20 oz - 12/ctn	\$30.50	12/19 OZ	\$24.97		\$47.52	Package of 6	\$26.98	12 CANS/CS								\$24.52	12/20oz						
Cleaner, Stainless Steel, Aerosol 20 oz. Cans	12/cs	3	\$22.39	12-quarts	\$29.52	1	\$35.40	12/18oz	\$39.61	15 oz - 12/ctn	\$31.85	12/18 OZ	\$34.87		\$4.05	Each	\$27.95	12 CANS/CS								\$26.84	12/20oz						
Cleaner, Toilet Bowl, High Acid, quarts (Simoniz)	1 gal.	5	\$18.44	12-quarts	\$7.86	384	\$34.04	12/32oz			\$1.75	QT	\$6.46		\$3.04	Each	NO BID									\$14.99	12/32oz/case						
Cleanser, All Purpose Neutral (AP-7)	4/ gal cs	21	\$15.85	4x1	\$52.78	4	\$26.44	4/1gal			\$22.60	4/1 GAL	\$20.33		\$25.17	Each	NO BID									\$28.03	4/gal/case						
Cleanser, Scouring Powder, 14 oz. (B)	case	2	\$16.00	24/21	\$36.48	1	\$17.85	24/21oz			\$14.70	24/21 OZ			\$37.19	Pack of 24	\$25.98	24 CANS/CS								\$15.92	24/21ozcan/case						
Clorox Clean-up, 9/32 oz	1000/cs	1	\$37.55	8x32	\$51.99	9	\$39.79	9/32oz	\$34.63	32 oz - 9/ctn	\$34.05	9/32 OZ			\$36.50	Pack of 9	\$50.95	12 CANS/CS								\$28.75	9/32oz/case						
Cups, 8 oz hot/cold with handles	1,000/cs	20	\$60.20	1000	\$94.39	1000	\$55.67	1000/cs	\$70.48	8 oz / 1000/ctn	\$66.43	1000			\$6.57	Pack of 50	NO BID									\$56.83	1000/case						
Cups, foam, 12 oz.	1000/cs	42	\$23.96	1000	\$26.18	1000	\$25.88	1000/cs	\$30.22	12 oz / 1000/ctn	\$25.00	1000			\$36.06	Pack of 300	NO BID									1000/case							
Cups, foam, 6 oz.	2500/cs	18	\$14.38	1000	\$51.00	1000	\$15.59	1000/cs	\$18.22	6 oz / 1000/ctn	\$11.30	1000			\$21.06	Pack of 1,000	NO BID									1000/case							
Cups, translucent plastic, 5oz	1 gal.	2	\$30.99	2500	\$0.03	2500	\$30.92	2500/cs	\$41.87	5 oz / 2430/ctn	\$33.75	1000			\$21.54	Pack of 750	NO BID									\$31.99	2500/case						
Dish Detergent, (Emerald Green / Da	5 gal.	52	\$20.00	5 pail	\$56.14	4	\$21.56	5gal			\$65.00	5GAL			\$41.89	Pack of 8	NO BID									\$41.78	5gal/pail						
Dust Mop Frame, snap on 48" x 5"	each	3	\$5.90	Ea	\$3.89	1	\$7.69	each	\$37.09	12/ctn	\$3.90	EACH	\$4.46		\$4.16	Each	\$4.89	1/CS								\$3.75	each						
Dust Mop, cotton, 48" x 5"	5/cs	6	\$8.26	Ea.	\$41.65	1	\$84.71	12/cs	\$37.81	6/ctn	\$63.00	6/CS	\$63.42		\$8.09	Each	\$5.97	6/CS															
Floor machine pads: polish 20" white	5/cs	30	\$14.89	Cs	\$16.67	5	\$19.32	5/cs	\$13.88	5/ctn	\$12.27	5/CS	\$13.02		\$9.81	Pack of 5	\$11.79	5/CS								\$11.42	5/case						
Floor machine pads: primer 20" red	5/cs	20	\$14.89	Cs	\$16.67	5	\$19.32	5/cs	\$13.88	5/ctn	\$12.27	5/CS	\$13.02		\$12.31	Pack of 5	\$11.79	5/CS								\$11.42	5/case						
Floor machine pads: stripper 20" black	5 gal	20	\$14.89	Cs	\$19.27	5	\$19.88	5/cs	\$13.88	5/ctn	\$12.27	5/CS	\$13.04		\$11.68	Pack of 5	\$11.79	5/CS								\$11.42	5/case						
Floor polish, high solids, high traffic, high gloss	5 gal	8	\$49.00	5 gal	\$53.99	1	\$78.79	5gal			\$51.00	5 GAL	\$47.39		\$14.50	Each	NO BID									\$51.00	5gal/pail						
Floor wax stripper, heavy duty	250/cs	3	\$33.30	5 gal	\$45.99	1	\$65.44	5gal			\$46.75	5 GAL			\$13.12	Pack of 4	NO BID									\$51.09	5gal/pail						
Foil tray with lids (cardboard w/foil underside) "Senior Citizen Tray Combo"	1 rl/cs	50	\$42.48	200			\$44.12	250/cs			NB						NO BID									250/case			\$26.92	1 ROLL/CS			
Foil, aluminum, 18"x500', heavy duty	12/case	16	\$13.97	Rl			\$14.65	18"x500' roll			\$20.10	HD ROLL			\$31.44	Each	NO BID									\$19.57	roll						

			Westcott Group (Eastern) \$0 delivery, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned	Staples, \$35.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned	Regional Distributors, \$150 minimum order, Tuesday delivery, sales rep assigned	Veritiv (Xpedx), \$250 minimum order, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned	Dobmeier, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery Wednesday, sales rep assigned	Corr, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery unknown, sales rep assigned	Grainger, \$? Minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned	Pyramid, \$25 minimum delivery, delivery M-5, saels rep assigned	Ecolab, \$1 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned	Palmer, \$1 minimum order, delivery T,Th,S, sales rep assigned	Buffalo, \$150 minimum order, delivery Friday, sales rep assigned	All American, \$500.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned	Central Poly, \$0.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned	Dash, 1 cs minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned															
ITEM DESCRIPTION	CASE SIZE	ANNUAL USAGE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE					
<b>items may be ordered by one or more departments.</b>																															
Furniture Polish (Pledge equivalent)	100 bag	1	\$26.60	20-Dec	\$2.26	1	\$37.20	12/16.5oz	\$29.91	19 oz / 12/ctn	\$27.35	12/18 OZ		\$53.36	Pack of 12																
Gloves, latex, size XL, 100 count, powder free, "kitchen use"	1,000/cs	30	\$36.54	10/100	\$37.65	1000	\$42.90	10/100/cs	\$38.81	10 box /ctn - 1000/ctn	\$37.95	1000	\$41.99		\$6.12	Pack of 100											\$28.12	12/case			
Gloves, Small flock lined (dish wash)	1,000/cs	1	\$8.99	12	\$5.39	12	\$106.80	12/12/cs	\$72.11	144 pairs/ctn	\$7.99	DOZEN	\$6.53		\$0.61	Per pair											\$5.90	doz/pair/bag			
Gloves, Vinyl, size M, 100 count, powder free, "kitchen use"	1,000/cs	28	\$19.25	10/100	\$22.65	1000	\$21.00	10/100/cs	\$24.44	10 box /ctn - 1000/ctn	\$25.65	1000	\$25.41		\$3.46	Pack of 100											\$17.95	10/100box/case			
Gloves, Vinyl, size L, 100 count, powder free, "kitchen use"	1,000/cs	4	\$19.25	10/100	\$22.65	1000	\$21.00	10/100/cs	\$24.44	10 box /ctn - 1000/ctn	\$25.65	1000	\$25.53		\$3.60	Pack of 100											\$17.95	10/100box/case			
Gloves, Vinyl, size XL, 100 count, powder free, "kitchen use"	1,000/cs	30	\$19.25	10/100	\$22.65	1000	\$21.00	10/100/cs	\$24.44	10 box /ctn - 1000/ctn	\$25.65	1000	\$37.39		\$3.60	Pack of 100											\$17.95	10/100box/case			
Hairnets, light brown	144/cs	1	\$16.95	144	\$6.89	1000	\$10.48	144/box	\$51.11	10 box /ctn - 1000/ctn	\$18.75	144/CS			\$10.07	Pack of 144												\$10.75	144/box		
Hand Sanitizer Cartridges, Antibacterial Gel, Alcohol Free	6/1000 ML	4	\$42.31	6			\$51.84	6/1000ml	\$28.16	1200ml - 2/ctn	\$46.95	6/1000			\$57.83	Pack of 6															
Hand Sanitizer Cartridges, Antibacterial Gel, Alcohol Free	12/800 ML	21	\$39.44	12/800	\$116.30	6	\$51.84	6/1000ml	\$108.34	800ML - 12/CTN	NB				\$57.83	Pack of 6												\$46.98	6/1000/case		
Hand Sanitizer (Dermagel Grn Sanitiz)	gal	8	\$18.30	gal	\$15.95	1	\$55.75	4/1gal				NB			\$52.65	Pack of 12												\$15.79	4 1gal/CS		
Hand soap cartridges, enriched lotion	12/800 ML	35	\$21.79	12/800	\$24.35	12	\$44.65	6/1000ml	\$83.78	800ML - 12/ctn	\$24.95	12/800	\$27.06		\$32.89	Pack of 12												\$24.35	12 800ml/CS		
Hand soap, liquid, enriched lotion	4 gal/cs	18	\$14.50	4x1	\$15.15	4	\$20.03	4/1gal	\$36.99	1 gal - 4/ctn	\$25.20	4/GAL	\$26.04		\$32.89	Pack of 12												\$17.89	4/gal/case		
Hand soap cartridges, pumice	4/2000 ML	3	\$67.76	Apr-00	\$56.54	4	\$56.36	4/2000ml	\$60.66	2000ML - 4/ctn	\$52.85	4/2000 ML			\$12.85	Each												\$50.65	4 2000ml/CS		
Kraft Bag, #10 LB, 500/bdl (large brd)	500 bundle	3	\$11.60	500			\$13.20	500/pack			\$10.80	500/BD			\$15.89	Pack of 500													\$9.65	500/bundle	
Lids, Cup for 8 oz hot/cold	1000/cs	2	\$20.76	1000	\$16.10	1000	\$26.34	1000/cs	\$32.24	8 oz lid / 1000/ctn	\$8.00	1000			\$ 29.64	Pack of 1,000													\$30.38	1000/case	
Lime Scale Remover	4/16 oz	12	\$35.40	4x1	\$10.78	32	\$13.31	gallon (128oz)	\$30.58	32oz - 12/ctn	\$21.50	6/22 OZ			\$10.33	Each													\$25.64	4/gal/case	
Mop Handle, for mop head below	each	103	\$4.50	Ea	\$9.61	1	\$5.00	each	\$4.08	12/ctn	\$3.40	EACH	\$6.91		\$ 4.36	Each													\$3.50	12 EA/CTN	
Mop Head, lay flat, 20 oz. (must screw into handle)	each	615	\$4.14	Ea	\$6.42	1	\$4.59	each	\$3.54	12/ctn	\$2.69	EACH	\$3.58		\$3.40	Each													\$3.49	12 EA/CTN	
Mop Head, medium weight	1 each	3	\$4.65	Ea	\$5.43	1	\$3.71	each	\$35.82	12/ctn	\$2.40	EACH	\$2.57		\$2.63	Each														\$2.28	12 EA/CTN
Napkins, white paper fold 1/4, 1 ply	6000/cs	11	\$24.20	6000			\$49.76	6000/cs	\$49.18	6000/ctn	\$26.00	6000	\$30.16		\$47.76	Pack of 300														\$23.76	12/500pack/case
Paper towel, (Bay West #314) white roll, 8 x 800'	6/cs	100	\$34.70	6	\$20.31	6	\$55.81	6/1000/cs	\$26.08	6/ctn	NB				\$35.28	Pack of 5														\$19.33	6/case
Paper towels, C-Fold		24	\$14.15	2400	\$21.12	2400	\$15.06	2400/cs	\$18.01	2400/ctn	\$13.62	2400/CS	\$17.95		\$26.20	Pack of 12														\$12.43	2400/case
Paper towels, rolled, brown, 8" wide x 435', 1 1/2" core	8/cs	22	\$13.99	12	\$19.09	4200	\$13.92	12/350/cs	\$28.86	12/ctn	\$18.35	12/CS	\$21.37		\$26.74	Pack of 12														\$23.10	12/case
Paper towels, square brown single-fold hand towels, 9.25x10.25	4,000/cs	5	\$14.88	4000	\$19.59	4000	\$16.06	4000/cs	\$17.14	16/ctn	\$18.05	4000	\$16.67		\$22.02	Pack of 16														\$14.12	4000/case
Paper Towels, White Multi-fold	4000/cs	5	\$13.99	4000	\$18.05	4000	\$16.41	4000/cs	\$18.63	16/ctn	\$14.60	4000/CS	\$19.78		\$29.31	Pack of 16														\$14.12	4000/case
Paper towels, white roll, 70 sheets per roll	30 rl/cs	548	\$13.97	30	\$23.11	30	\$14.72	30/cs	\$22.98	84 sht/rl - 30/ctn	\$18.30	30RL/85SH	\$21.07		\$30	Pack of 30														\$18.25	30rolls/case
Plastic Wrap, 18"x2000'	1 rl/cs	11	\$12.86	R1	\$16.52	1	\$13.18	18"x2000' roll			\$13.72	1 ROLL			\$17.50	Each														\$11.88	roll
Plate, foam, 9". 3 compartment, white laminated surface	500/cs	45	\$12.99	500			\$18.69	500/cs	\$20.19	500/ctn	\$31.50	500/CS			\$22.50	Pack of 500														\$17.60	4/125ct/case
Plate, paper, white 6", uncoated	500/cs	9	\$10.99	1000	\$6.28	1000	\$10.59	1000/cs	\$9.63	1000/ctn	\$13.45	500/CS			\$14.38	Pack of 1,000														\$10.50	10/100ct/case
Plates, styrofoam 10"	500/cs	12	\$13.99	500	\$38.29	500	\$22.77	500/cs	\$25.67	500/ctn	\$31.15	500/CS			\$34.72	Pack of 500														\$29.84	4/125ct/case

			Westcott Group (Eastern) \$0 delivery, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Staples, \$35.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Regional Distributors, \$150 minimum order, Tuesday delivery, sales rep assigned		Veritiv (Xpedx), \$250 minimum order, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Dobmeier, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery Wednesday, sales rep assigned		Corr, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery unknown, sales rep assigned		Grainger, \$? Minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Pyramid, \$25 minimum order, delivery M-5, sales rep assigned		Ecolab, \$1 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Palmer, \$1 minimum order, delivery T,Th,S, sales rep assigned		Buffalo, \$150 minimum order, delivery Friday, sales rep assigned		All American, \$500.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Central Poly, \$0.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Dash, 1 cs minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		
ITEM DESCRIPTION	CASE SIZE	ANNUAL USAGE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	
<b>items may be ordered by one or more departments.</b>																															
PVC Film, 18' x 2000'		4	\$12.86	rl			\$13.18	18"x2000' roll			\$13.72	1 ROLL			\$143.77	Each	NO BID							\$11.88	roll			\$16.30			
Sanitary Napkin Dispenser liners, floor dispenser	1000/cs	2	\$14.90	Ea			\$19.61	500/cs			\$13.20	250					\$13.47	500/CS						\$25.99	500/case						
Sanitary Napkin Dispenser liners, wall mount units	500/cs	4	\$15.10	500			\$15.67	500/cs			\$12.05	500/CS			\$145.75	Each	\$13.47	500/CS						\$13.25	500/case						
Sanitary Napkins	250/cs	2	\$32.00	250	\$37.31		\$39.04	250/cs	\$30.68	250/ctn	\$24.50	250/CS			\$61.11	Each	\$25.99	250/CS						\$25.88	250/case						
Scouring Pad, green 6 x 9	10/pk	5	\$4.00	10/Pk	\$5.79		\$2.54	10/pack	\$5.36	20/ctn	\$2.50	10PK	\$2.59		\$6.08	Pack of 20	\$2.39	10/PKG						\$4.40	20ct/case						
Scouring Pad, green 3 x 4.5	10/pk	3	\$4.00	10/Pk	\$7.40		\$2.54	10/pack				NB			\$28.40	Pack of 80	\$2.53	10/PKG						\$13.88	3/12ct/case						
Sponge, all purpose with scour back	5/pk	33	\$4.25	5/Pk	\$4.83		\$21.13	20/case	\$14.96	5/pkg 20/ctn	\$3.00	5/PK			\$64.58	Pack of 40	\$2.79	5/PKG						\$11.30	20/case						
Sponge, scrubbing	8 - 5/pk	4	\$4.25	5/Pk	\$75.96		\$21.13	20/case	\$14.96	5/pkg 20/ctn	\$23.90	40/CS	\$28.94		\$ 64.58	Pack of 40	\$20.89	8 5/CS						\$11.30	20/case						
Sponges, all purpose	5/pk	12	\$4.80	5/Pk	\$2.39		\$1.08	each	\$33.32	2/pkg 48/ctn	\$6.45	5/PK			\$ 1.57	Each	\$3.95	5/PKG						\$6.64	8/pack						
Spray Buff (flooring)	gal	20	\$31.35	4x1	\$26.15		\$3.35	12/32oz			\$13.20	4QTS	\$7.74		\$ 74.83	Pack of 12	NO BID							\$67.39	6/liters/case						
Tampons	500/cs	2	\$69.90	500	\$59.19		\$51.14	500/cs	\$56.58	500/ctn	\$52.80	500/CS	\$76.49		\$ 61.11	Pack of 500	\$51.09	500/CS						\$51.10	500/case						
Toilet tissue, 2 ply roll, 500 sheets	96 rls/cs	461	\$24.99	96	\$34.23		\$27.78	96/500	\$38.50	96/ctn	\$31.45	96/CS	\$34.00		\$ 29.72	Pack of 48	NO BID							\$28.24	96ct/case			\$31.66	96/CS		
Trash Liner, hi-molecular (Mobil 36"x60", 56 gal)	200/cs	50	\$16.99	200	\$22.16		\$23.86	38"x58" 200/cs	\$24.14	200/ctn	\$24.95	200	\$17.86		\$ 30.50	Pack of 150	NO BID							\$23.31	200/case	\$19.20	200/CS				
Trash Liners, 10 micron, clear, 30x37	500/cs	20	\$16.00	500	\$20.77		\$17.19	30"x36" 500/cs	\$18.29	500/ctn	\$15.70	500	\$18.89		\$ 20.09	Pack of 500	NO BID							\$29.95	500/case	\$15.90	500/CS				
Trash Liners, 14 micron, clear, 43x48	500/cs	52	\$16.49	200	\$57.25		\$17.63	43"x46" 200/cs	\$18.93	200/ctn	NB		\$19.91		\$ 26.81	Pack of 200	NO BID							\$22.27	200/case	\$18.50	500/CS				
Trash Liners, 14 micron, clear, 33 gal. 33x40	500/cs	102	\$15.18	250	\$29.42		\$26.05	33"x39" 500/cs	\$15.11	250/ctn	\$15.40	250	\$23.23		\$ 16.93	Pack of 250	NO BID							\$17.80	250/case	\$18.20	500/CS				
Trash Liners, 14 micron, clear, 60 gal. 38x60	200/cs	32	\$18.17	200	\$22.16		\$23.87	38"x58" 200/cs	\$20.98	200/ctn	\$19.75	200	\$26.71		\$ 25.37	Pack of 200	NO BID							\$16.40	100/case	\$17.90	200/CS				
Trash Liners, 16 micron, clear, 56 gal. 43x48	200/cs	20	\$18.05	200	\$22.90		\$20.16	43"x46" 200/cs	\$21.73	200/ctn	\$20.35	200	\$22.75		\$ 26.81	Pack of 200	NO BID							\$14.84	100/case	\$18.90	200/CS				
Trash Liners, 3 ply super tuff, black, 55 gal., 38x58	100/cs	15	\$22.56	100	\$18.69		\$18.55	38"x58" 100/cs	\$21.86	100/ctn	\$30.48	100 2mil	\$28.45		\$ 16.12	Pack of 50	NO BID							\$23.49	100/case	\$19.10	100/CS				
Trash Liners, 8 micron, clear, 12-16 gal., 24x33	1000/cs	57	\$17.62	1000	\$23.52		\$19.86	24"x31" 1000/cs	\$23.71	1000/ctn	NB		\$23.58		\$ 25.40	Pack of 1,000	NO BID							\$23.74	500/case	\$14.90	1000/CS				
Trash Liners, 8 micron, clear, 7-10 gal., 24x24	1000/cs	30	\$12.81	1000	\$18.70		\$15.08	24"x23" 1000/cs	\$17.28	1000/ctn	NB		\$12.80		\$ 18.30	Pack of 1,000	NO BID							\$17.26	500/case	\$12.20	1000/CS				
Trash Liners, Blue, 1.2 mil thick, 22x16x58 (recycling only)	100/CS	10	\$25.59	100			\$23.16	38"x58", 150/cs	\$21.33	100/ctn	NB				\$ 31.43	Pack of 100	NO BID									\$24.00	100/CS				
Windshield Cleaner	98 bx/cs	3	\$14.10	6							\$12.95	6/1GAL			\$ 3.19	Each	NO BID							\$48.00	10/100ct/case						
Wipes, handi-wipe, 100/box	6/1 gal	2	\$17.75	200			\$13.18	200/box			\$23.40	150/CS			\$ 30.50	Pack of 15	NO BID							\$14.88	200/case						
Ziplock bags, 1 gal., 10 x 11	250 box	41	\$19.99	250	\$22.38		\$13.32	250/cs	\$25.82	250/ctn	\$53.00	1000/CS					\$11.99	250/BX						\$36.00	1000/case						
Ziplock bags, quart	250 box	30	\$18.99	500	\$19.38		\$13.40	500/cs	\$31.62	500/ctn	\$26.70	500/CS			\$ 4.23	Pack of 19								\$5.98	250/BX			\$21.25	1000/case		
															\$ 5.27	Pack of 48															
<b>Dispensers and Products Used by the Livingston County Jail. Vendor must provide and maintain the dispensers at no added cost to the County.</b>																															
<b>All chemicals are concentrates</b>		<b>Jail Only</b>																													
Dishwasher Soap Dispenser for two (2) chemicals		1 unit										NC																			
Dishwasher Chemicals: Low Temperature Detergent	5 gal	8									\$66.50	5GAL								\$53.87	5 gallon			\$69.95	5 gallon	\$88.99	5gal				

			Westcott Group (Eastern) \$0 delivery, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Staples, \$35.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Regional Distributors, \$150 minimum order, Tuesday delivery, sales rep assigned		Veritiv (Xpedx), \$250 minimum order, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Dobmeier, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery Wednesday, sales rep assigned		Corr, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery unknown, sales rep assigned		Grainger, \$? Minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Pyramid, \$25 minimum delivery, delivery M-5, saels rep assigned		Ecolab, \$1 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Palmer, \$1 minimum order, delivery T,Th,S, sales rep assigned		Buffalo, \$150 minimum order, delivery Friday, sales rep assigned		All American, \$500.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Central Poly, \$0.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Dash, 1 cs minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		
ITEM DESCRIPTION	CASE SIZE	ANNUAL USAGE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	
<b>items may be ordered by one or more departments.</b>																															
Dishwasher Chemicals: Rinse Aid	5 gal	9										\$87.00	5GAL							\$102.46	5 gallon	\$98.95	5 gallon	\$107.31	5gal						
Laundry Soap Dispensers for three (3) chemicals		4 units										NC								No Charge											
Laundry Chemicals: Color Safe Bleach	5 gal	64										\$103.40	5GAL							\$105.24	5 gallon	\$69.95	5 gallon	\$58.29	5gal						
Laundry Chemicals: Detergent	5 gal	59										\$98.10	5GAL							\$94.12	5 gallon	\$94.95	5 gallon	\$82.83	5gal						
Laundry Chemicals: Softener	5 gal	17										\$67.10	5GAL							\$62.23	5 gallon	\$69.95	5 gallon	\$103.21	5gal						
Janitorial Chemical Dispensers for four (4) chemicals		5 units			\$446.85	1						FREE	EACH							No Charge											
All purpose orange cleaner	1 gal	150			\$17.99	1			.16/gal	ez-mix , see cost	\$175.00	2/2.5 LITER								\$59.60	2.5 gallon	\$29.95	2 x 1 gallon	\$35.36	4/gal/case						
Floor Cleaner (degreaser)	1 gal	148			\$17.24	1			.63/gal	ez-mix , see cost	\$104.60	2/2.5 LITER								\$40.95	2.5 gallon	\$79.95	4 x 1 gallon	\$41.83	4/gal/case						
Grade A Sanitizer (kitchen)	1 gal	88			\$13.82	1			18.39/gal	1 gal - 4/ctn	\$58.75	2/2.5 LITER								\$60.12	2.5 gallon	\$79.95	4 x 1gallon	\$32.57	2/gal/case						
Glass Cleaner	1 gal	36			\$22.57	1			.63/gal	ez-mix , see cost	\$58.60	2/2.5 LITER								\$62.19	2.5 gallon	\$29.95	4 x 1 gallon	\$59.41	2/64oz/case						
<b>Products Requested Specifically by Central Services and are in no particular order.</b>																															
	<b>Central Services Only</b>																														
Bacterial Treatment for drains and septic systems, Digest or comparable	1 gal	48	\$29.33	4x1	\$10.17	1 gal				\$69.68	1 gal - 4/ctn	\$11.20	GALLON	\$7.41		\$91.83	Pack of 12	NO BID						\$84.68	4.51b capsule						
Septic System Odor Eliminator Treatment, Eliminate or comparable	1 gal	24	\$29.33	4x1	\$10.17	1 gal						\$10.25	GALLON			\$47.23	Each	NO BID						\$98.77	4.51b capsule						
Liquid Laundry Detergent, with OxiClean, (50 - 90 oz.) Arm & Hammer or comparable	ea	70	\$49.00	6-61.25						\$37.57	64 oz - 4/ctn	\$6.00	61.25 OZ			\$39.85	Pack of 6	NO BID						\$56.84	2/1 gal/case						
Vinyl Protect, 1 gal., ArmorAll or comparable	ea	4										\$127.80	4/1 CASE			\$51.49	Pack of 6	NO BID													
General Purpose Trigger Sprayer, 7 1/2",	ea	12	\$0.49	Ea								\$0.49	EACH	\$0.40		\$0.91	Each	\$0.39	EA					\$0.31	each						
Plastic Bottle, 16 oz capacity	ea	12	\$0.49	Ea								\$0.49	EACH	\$0.55		\$16.31	Pack of 12	\$0.41	EA					\$0.36	each						
Advanced Formula Instant Hand Sanitizer, 2 oz, Purell or comparable	ea	12	\$60.50	24/2 oz	\$15.60	24				\$39.16	2 oz - 24/ctn	\$2.74	EACH			\$88.29	Pack of 24	\$0.99	2oz BOTTLE					\$22.40	24/case						
Advanced Formula Instant Hand Sanitizer, 8 oz, Purell or comparable	ea	12	\$68.43	12/8oz	\$31.68	12				\$43.49	8 oz - 12/ctn	\$2.49	7.50 OZ			\$3.40	Each	\$1.89	8oz BOTTLE					\$53.46	24/case						
Advanced Formula Instant Hand Sanitizer, 12 oz, Purell or comparable	ea	12	\$90.46	12/12oz	\$43.08	12				\$57.46	12 oz - 12/ctr	\$3.90	1-12 OZ			\$8.00	Each	\$2.98	18oz BOTTLE					\$68.04	12/case						
Advanced Formula Instant Hand Sanitizer, 20 oz, Purell or comparable	ea	12	\$149.80	12/20oz	\$88.68	12				\$95.11	20 oz - 12/ctr	\$7.20	1-20 OZ			\$8.38	Each	\$2.98	18oz BOTTLE					\$68.04	12/case						
Super Loop Wet Mop Head, sz Medium, Blue Yarn Color, UniSan or comparable	ea	6	\$10.90	Ea						\$39.74	12/ctn	\$8.50	EACH	\$4.48		\$6.34	Each	\$3.29	EA												
Super Loop Wet Mop Head, sz Medium, Green Yarn Color, UniSan or comparable	ea	6	\$10.90	Ea						\$66.67	12/ctn	\$7.25	EACH	\$4.48		\$6.34	Each	\$3.99	EA												
Super Loop Wet Mop Head, sz Medium, Orange Yarn Color, UniSan or comparable	ea	6	\$10.90	Ea						\$66.67	12/ctn	\$8.50	EACH	\$4.48		\$6.34	Each	NO BID													
Super Loop Wet Mop Head, sz Medium, White Yarn Color, UniSan or comparable	ea	6	\$10.90	Ea						\$36.14	12/ctn	\$7.25	EACH	\$4.48		\$6.43	Each	\$3.29	EA												
Janitor Style Screw Clamp Wet Mop Handle, 64-in. length	ea	6	\$39.75	Ea						\$59.12	12/ctn	\$9.75	EACH	\$7.59		\$4.36	Each	\$5.25	EA					\$7.31	each						
Side Press Mop Bucket Combo, includes bucket and wringer, 8.75-gallon, UniSan or comparable	ea	4			\$57.07	each				\$54.85	1/ctn	\$44.95	EACH	\$50.55		\$111.54	Each	\$41.98	EA					\$51.50	each						
Flexible Head Overhead Dusting Tool, includes frame w/60" aluminum handle, Rubbermaid or comparable	ea	6										\$26.98	EACH			\$19.01	Each	NO BID													



			Westcott Group (Eastern) \$0 delivery, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Staples, \$35.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Regional Distributors, \$150 minimum order, Tuesday delivery, sales rep assigned		Veritiv (Xpedx), \$250 minimum order, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Dobmeier, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery Wednesday, sales rep assigned		Corr, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery unknown, sales rep assigned		Grainger, \$? Minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Pyramid, \$25 minimum delivery, delivery M-5, saels rep assigned		Ecolab, \$1 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Palmer, \$1 minimum order, delivery T,Th,S, sales rep assigned		Buffalo, \$150 minimum order, delivery Friday, sales rep assigned		All American, \$500.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Central Poly, \$0.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Dash, 1 cs minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned			
ITEM DESCRIPTION	CASE SIZE	ANNUAL USAGE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE		
<b>items may be ordered by one or more departments.</b>																																
Dist Mitt, launderable, attachable to Overhead Dusting Tool (above) Rubbermaid or comparable	ea	12							\$150.93	12/ctn	\$6.55	1		\$8.18	Each	NO BID										\$2.55	each					
Toilet Bowl Brush, synthetic polypropylene bristles, white, 14 1/2" length, Rubbermaid or comparable	ea	12			\$4.05	each			\$1.62	24/ctn - priced each	\$1.35	EA	\$0.99	\$0.60	Each		\$1.59	EA								\$2.44	each					
Toilet Bowl Brush Holder (for brush above), 5-in diameter, white, Rubbermaid or comparable	ea	12			\$4.05	each			\$1.83	24/ctn - priced each	\$1.65	EA		\$4.11	Each		\$5.99	EA								\$3.50	each					
ErgoToilet Bowl Brush System with Holder, includes holder, 26" handle, and two 3.5"dia. brush heads, Unger or	ea	4										NB		\$16.83	Each		\$13.99	EA														
Metal-tip Threaded End Broom Handles, 60" length, 15/16" dia., Boardwalk or comparable	ea	12			\$3.90	each			\$39.89	12/ctn	\$2.40	EA	\$2.18	\$2.38	Each		\$2.09	EA								\$3.10	each					
Metal-tip Threaded End Broom Handles, 60" length, 1 1/8" dia., Boardwalk or comparable	ea	12	\$4.63	Ea	\$3.33	each						NB	\$2.18	\$2.38	Each		\$2.98	EA								\$3.79	each					
Angler Brooms, Metal handle, 13" sweeping surface, 55" long, 7/8" dia. Handle, Unisan or comparable	ea	12							\$65.69	12/ctn	\$6.25	EA	\$4.42	\$11.69	Each		\$3.59	EA								\$5.18	each					
Upright Dust Pan, 12 1/2" wide, 37" height, black, Rubbermaid LobbyPro or comparable	ea	12			\$16.20	each			\$8.77		\$7.30	EACH	\$6.91	\$12.39	Each		\$7.98	EA								\$6.15	each					
<b>The following items will not be included in the overall bid tabulation. Items will be purchased if needed. A separate contract may be awarded.</b>																																
	<b>Central Services Only</b>																															
Super-Soaker Indoor Wiper/Scraper Mat, 3/8" overall thickness, 34" x 119", Charcoal color, Crown or comparable	ea	2							\$106.08	3' x 10'	\$296.12	EACH		\$ 128.15	Each	\$140.95	EA										\$127.55	each				
Super-Soaker Indoor Wiper/Scraper Mat, 3/8" overall thickness, 34" x 58", Charcoal color, Crown or comparable	ea	2							\$53.04	3' x 5'	\$152.70	EACH		\$ 62.86	Each	\$70.95	EA										\$64.45	each				
Super-Soaker Indoor Wiper/Scraper Mat, 3/8" overall thickness, 45" x 68", Charcoal color, Crown or comparable	ea	6							\$84.83	4' x 6'	\$238.25	EACH		\$ 100.17	Each	\$112.99	EA										\$104.33	each				
Cleated Chair Mats for carpets up to 5/8" deep, Overall size 36 x 48, Lip size 20 x 12, Universal or comparable	ea	6							\$33.84	36 x 48	\$63.00	1-53X45 W/LIP		\$ 31.76	Each	NO BID																
Cleated Chair Mats for carpets up to 5/8" deep, Overall size 45 x 53, Lip size 25 x 12, Universal or comparable	ea	6							\$41.64	45 x 53	\$63.00	1-SAME MEASURE		\$ 34.64	Each	NO BID											\$63.25	each				
Cleated Chair Mats, without lip, for carpets up to 5/8" deep, Overall size 46 x 60, Universal or comparable	ea	6							\$54.72	46 x 60	\$86.00	1-SAME MEASURE		\$ 45.76	Each	NO BID											\$86.75	each				
Lightweight Commercial Upright Vacuum 5.0 amp, 12" cleaning path, Sanitaire or comparable to EUR679	ea	4			??				\$126.09	1/ea	\$116.00		\$113.14	\$ 119.86	Each	\$149.98	EA										\$150.00	each				
Two-Stage Industrial Wet/Dry Vac, 2.5 HP motor, 12' hose, 12-gal. capacity, with attachments, Shop-vac or comparable to #SHP9622110	ea	2									\$473.00	SSS BLACKCAT 18GAL	\$309.55	\$ 159.51	Each	NO BID																
Heavy-Duty Portable Wet/Dry Vac, 5.5 HP motor, 7' hose, 5-gal. Capacity, with attachments, Shop-Vac or comparable to #SHP5872410	ea	2									NB		\$143.59	\$ 80.90	Each	NO BID																
Wet/Dry Vac, 3.0 HP motor, 8' hose, 6-gal. capacity, with attachments, Shop-Vac or comparable to #SHP9650610	ea	2									NB		\$143.59	\$ 54.83	Each	NO BID																
Heavy-Duty Wet/Dry Vac, 5.0 HP motor, 12' hose, 12-gal. capacity, with attachments, Shop-Vac or comparable to #SHP9625110	ea	2									NB		\$309.55	\$ 92.62	Each	NO BID																
20" Floor Machine, 1.5 HP motor, Sanitaire or comparable to #EUR6025A	ea	1			\$851.80	each			\$854.74	1/ea	499	1-1.5 HP W/PAD DRIVER	\$576.35	\$,593.31	Each	\$889.98	EA										\$765.00	each				

			Westcott Group (Eastern) \$0 delivery, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Staples, \$35.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Regional Distributors, \$150 minimum order, Tuesday delivery, sales rep assigned		Veritiv (Xpedx), \$250 minimum order, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Dobmeier, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery Wednesday, sales rep assigned		Corr, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery unknown, sales rep assigned		Grainger, \$? Minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Pyramid, \$25 minimum order, delivery M-5, sales rep assigned		Ecolab, \$1 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Palmer, \$1 minimum order, delivery T,Th,S, sales rep assigned		Buffalo, \$150 minimum order, delivery Friday, sales rep assigned		All American, \$500.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Central Poly, \$0.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Dash, 1 cs minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		
ITEM DESCRIPTION	CASE SIZE	ANNUAL USAGE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	
<b>items may be ordered by one or more departments.</b>																															
High Velocity Air Mover, 5.0AMP 1/2HP 3-speed motor with air velocity of 2700/3350/3800 FTM, Sanitaire or comparable to EUR6053	ea	4			\$247.70	each					\$192.00 \$212.50		\$158.90			\$221.95	EA					\$199.00	each								
Disposable Gloves, Nitrile, 9.5" length, 5 mils thick, size small, green, Ansell or comparable	100/bx	6			\$2.27	100					\$284.15	1/ea		Each		\$9.38		\$	6.74	Pack of 100									\$3.84	100/BOX	
Disposable Gloves, Nitrile, 9.5" length, 5 mils thick, size medium, green, Ansell or comparable	100/bx	20			\$2.27	100					\$43.84	1000/ctn		NB		\$5.10		\$	6.74	Pack of 100									\$3.84	100/BOX	
Disposable Gloves, Nitrile, 9.5" length, 5 mils thick, size large, green, Ansell or comparable	100/bx	20			\$2.27	100					\$43.84	1000/ctn		NB		\$4.98		\$	6.74	Pack of 100									\$3.84	100/BOX	
Premium Grain Leather Palm Gloves, 2 1/2" rubberized safety cuffs, size Large, Mustang or comparable	ea	24 pair												NB		\$0.89		\$	4.14	Per Pair				\$19.88	doz						
Premium Grain Leather Palm Gloves, 2 1/2" rubberized safety cuffs, size Extra-Large, Mustang or comparable	ea	24 pair												NB				\$	4.19	Per Pair				\$19.88	doz						
Flex Seamless Nylon Knit Glove, gray nylon shell, blue foam latex dipped palm and fingers, size small, MCR or comparable to #MCR96731S	ea	30 pair									\$315.68	25/box 300/c		NB				\$	19.25	Pack of 12				\$16.05	doz						
Hooded Coverall and boots, DuPont Tyvek, serged seam, front zip close, elastic wrist and ankles, White, sz 2XL comparable to DUP TY122S2XL	25/case	1																\$	153.13	Pack of 25				\$49.98	25/CS			\$125.77	25/case		
Hooded Coverall and boots, DuPont Tyvek, serged seam, front zip close, elastic wrist and ankles, White, sz 3XL comparable to DUP TY122S3XL	25/case	1																\$	162.50	Pack of 25				\$52.98	25/CS			\$134.40	25/case		
Hooded Coverall and boots, DuPont Tyvek, serged seam, front zip close, elastic wrist and ankles, White, sz 4XL comparable to DUP TY122S4XL	25/case	1			\$163.69	25												\$	152.58	Pack of 25				\$52.98	25/CS			\$145.15	25/case		
Shoe/Boot Cover, Spun-bond polypropylene, elastic top, water resistant, non-skid, Size Extra-Large, Blue, Impact or comparable	150/case	1									\$15.46	300/ctn		NB				\$	45.74	Pack of 200				\$37.99	150/CS			\$22.55	300/case		
Shoe/Boot Cover, Spun-bond polypropylene, elastic top, water resistant, non-skid, Size Large, Blue, Impact or comparable	150/case	1									\$15.46	300/ctn		NB				\$	45.54	Pack of 200				\$36.99	150/CS			\$21.55	300/case		
Safety Vest, ANSI Class 2 with Silver Reflective, 4-pocket, zip-front, Silver reflective tape, size Medium/Large, Orange, Kimberly-Clark Professional or comparable	ea	12			\$8.99	each												\$	8.25	Each				\$6.99	12 EA/CTN						
Safety Vest, ANSI Class 2 with Silver Reflective, 4-pocket, zip-front, Silver reflective tape, size XL/2XL, Orange, Kimberly-Clark Professional or	ea	12			\$8.99	each												\$	8.25	Each				\$6.99	12 EA/CTN						
Safety Vest, ANSI Class 2 with Silver Reflective, 4-pocket, zip-front, Silver reflective tape, size 3XL/4XL, Orange, Kimberly-Clark Professional or	ea	12																\$	8.25	Each				\$6.99	12 EA/CTN						
Safety Vest, ANSI Class 2 with Silver Reflective, 4-pocket, zip-front, Silver reflective tape, size Medium/Large, Lime (color), Kimberly-Clark Professional or comparable	ea	12			\$8.99	each												\$	30.94	Each				\$6.99	12 EA/CTN						
Safety Vest, ANSI Class 2 with Silver Reflective, 4-pocket, zip-front, Silver reflective tape, size XL/2XL, Lime (color) Kimberly-Clark Professional or	ea	12			\$5.97	each												\$	30.94	Each				\$6.99	12 EA/CTN						
Safety Vest, ANSI Class 2 with Silver Reflective, 4-pocket, zip-front, Silver reflective tape, size 3XL/4XL, Lime (color), Kimberly-Clark Professional or	ea	12																\$	30.94	Each				\$6.99	12 EA/CTN						
Noise-Reducing Earmuffs, NRR 30dB, Black, Howard Leight or comparable	ea	6			\$22.36	each												\$	16.82	Each											
Noise-Reducing Earmuffs, NRR 30dB, Bright Green, Howard Leight or comparable	ea	6			\$18.21	each												\$	17.56	Each					\$7.00	each					



			Westcott Group (Eastern) \$0 delivery, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Staples, \$35.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Regional Distributors, \$150 minimum order, Tuesday delivery, sales rep assigned		Veritiv (Xpedx), \$250 minimum order, Thursday delivery, sales rep assigned		Dobmeier, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery Wednesday, sales rep assigned		Corr, \$ ? Minimum order, delivery unknown, sales rep assigned		Grainger, \$? Minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Pyramid, \$25 minimum order, delivery M-5, saels rep assigned		Ecolab, \$1 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Palmer, \$1 minimum order, delivery T,Th,S, sales rep assigned		Buffalo, \$150 minimum order, delivery Friday, sales rep assigned		All American, \$500.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Central Poly, \$0.00 minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		Dash, 1 cs minimum order, delivery M-F, sales rep assigned		
ITEM DESCRIPTION	CASE SIZE	ANNUAL USAGE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	BID PRICE	PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE	
<b>items may be ordered by one or more departments.</b>																															
Round Containers and Lids, Seamless, polyethylene, reinforced rim and base, 55 gal., 26 1/2 x 33h, gray, Rubbermaid or comparable	ea	4									\$65.30	3/CS		\$ 41.36	Each											\$50.45	each				
Dome Top receptacle lid, converts 32-gal. containers into receptacles, textured finish gray, Rubbermaid or comparable to RCP 2637-88 GRA	ea	4			\$98.59	each					\$42.75	1CS		\$ 57.08	Each																
Dome Top receptacle lid, converts 44-gal. containers into receptacles, textured finish gray, Rubbermaid or comparable to RCP 2647-88 GRA	ea	4			\$142.31	each					\$45.15	1CS		\$ 56.05	Each										\$124.00	each					
Dome Top receptacle lid, converts 55-gal. containers into receptacles, textured finish gray, Rubbermaid or comparable to RCP 2657-88 GRA	ea	4			\$136.99	each					\$82.15	1CS		\$ 69.96	Each																
Quiet Dolly, five-caster, 250lb capacity, fits to and mobilizes Round Containers (above), 18 1/4 dia. X 6 5/8h, black, Rubbermaid or comparable to	ea	12			\$51.62	each					\$37.05	4/CS		\$ 28.25	Each											\$21.01	each				
16-cup Coffee Brewer, includes hot water reservoir, includes 10-cup glass carafe and coffee funnel, black, Bunn or comparable to BNNBxB	ea	1			\$99.42	each					\$37.05	4/CS		\$ 711.11	Each																
											\$37.05	4/CS																			
											\$37.05	4/CS																			
											\$37.05	4/CS																			
											\$63.36	2/CS																			
											\$50.90	2/CS																			
											\$53.00	2/CS																			
											\$70.90	2/CS																			
											\$26.90	1																			