

Livingston County Health Department Bid Sheet for Medical Supplies
2016

Description	Buffalo Hospital						Medline						School Health					
	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand
Alcohol 16 oz.	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 16.85	cs	y	proadvantage	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$11.42	cs	Yes	Medline	1	12	\$1.42	Package		Swan
Alcohol Prep Wipes	bx/200	cs/10	\$ 17.15	cs	n	dynarex	500ea/cs	500ea/cs	\$117.73	cs	Yes	Medline	200/box	10	\$2.22	Package	No	SH Brand
Allevyn 2x2 (UNI66027642)	pk/10	cs/6	\$ 35.67	pk	y	smith-nephew	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$145.20	cs	Yes	Medline						
Allevyn 6 x 6	bx/10	cs/3	\$ 120.75	bx	y	smith-nephew	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$272.15	cs	Yes	Medline						
Allevyn Adh 3x3 (UNI66020043)	bx/10	cs/4	\$ 31.37	bx	y	smith-nephew	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$133.49	cs	Yes	Medline						
Allevyn Adh 7 x 7	bx/10	cs/4	\$ 125.30	bx	y	smith-nephew	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$272.15	cs	Yes	Medline						
Allevyn Heel (UNI660076301)	bx/5	cs/6	\$ 49.14	bx	y	smith-nephew	40ea/cs	40ea/cs	\$183.03	cs	Yes	Medline						
Aquacel AG 4x4 (CVT403765)	bx/10		\$ 203.35	bx	y	convatec	50ea/cs	50ea/cs	\$189.93	cs	Yes	Medline						
Aquacel AG 6x6	bx/5		\$ 225.60	bx	y	convatec	50ea/cs	50ea/cs	\$528.88	cs	Yes	Medline						
Aquacel Pack ¾"	bx/5		\$ 116.85	bx	y	convatec	50ea/cs	50ea/cs	\$160.21	cs	Yes	Medline						
Autolet Lancets							10ea/cs	10ea/cs	\$86.92	cs	No	Owen Mumford						
Band-aids 3/4"	bx/100	cs/24	\$ 1.40	bx	n	dynarex	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$10.62	cs	No	Medline	100/box	24	\$2.27	Package	No	SH Brand Plastic
Band-aids 1"	bx/100	cs/24	\$ 1.65	bx	n	dynarex	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$11.86	cs	No	Medline	100/box	24	\$2.72	Package	No	SH Brand Plastic
Bandaid spots	bx/100	cs/48	\$ 1.45	bx	n	dynarex	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$9.94	cs	No	Medline	100/box	24	\$2.59	Package	No	SH Brand Plastic
Batteries AAA, AA, C, D SEE ALL BIDDERS	ct/24	cs/6	\$ 11.20	ct	y	duracell	72ea/cs	72ea/cs	\$36.68	cs	Yes	Medline						
Bard Drainage Bags (#153202, 200 ml)	ct/24	cs/6	\$ 108.30	ct	y	bard	10ea/cs	10ea/cs	\$45.51	cs	Yes	Medline						
Betadine 4 oz (HP108204)	ct/12	cs/6	\$ 130.63	ct	y	applicare	48ea/cs	48ea/cs	\$32.35	cs	Yes	Medline	1	36	\$9.34	Package		Purdue
Betadine Swabsticks	ct/12	cs/6	\$ 6.00	ct	y	dynarex	500ea/cs	500ea/cs	\$25.88	cs	Yes	Medline	200/box		\$51.88		No	Purdue
Betadine Wipes	ea/1	cs/20	\$ 4.30	cs	y	dynarex	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$16.90	cs	Yes	Medline						
Biohazard Bags & Labels (WHC) 24 x 24	cs/72			cs	y		1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$40.71	cs	Yes	Medline						
Blood Pressure Cuff - Infant / Pediatric	bx/75	cs/750	\$ 7.44	bx	pk/3	s2s global	1ea/ea	1ea/ea	\$9.92	ea	Yes	Medline	1		\$47.82	Package		Pedia Pals
BP Cuff, Hand Held regular	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 8.35	bx	n	s2s global	1ea/ea	1ea/ea	\$10.80	ea	Yes	Medline	1		\$252.16	Package		Welch Allyn
BP Cuff, Hand Held large			\$ 8.75			s2s global	1ea/ea	1ea/ea	\$12.39	ea	Yes	Medline						
Calmoseptine 4 oz tubes	ea/1		\$ 5.15	ea	y	dynarex	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$33.80	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheter Kits Foley	ea/1		\$ 71.55	ea	y	medtronic	20ea/cs	20ea/cs	\$26.55	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheter Kits Straight w/cath (KDL75035)	ea/1		\$ 1.67	ea	y	amsino	20ea/cs	20ea/cs	\$29.90	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheters 14" straight	cs/24		\$ 40.18	cs	y	amsino	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$5.14	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheters 16" straight	cs/20		\$ 40.18	cs	n	amsino	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$5.14	cs	Yes	Medline						
Cath Secures (SUB054452 (no dual tab)	ea/1	cs/20	\$ 3.15	ea	y	mc johnson	48ea/cs	48ea/cs	\$126.04	cs	Yes	Bird & Cronin Inc						
Catheters/Condom Texas (male external) various sizes	bx/100		\$ 142.86	bx	y	coloplast	25ea/cs	25ea/cs	\$6.86	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheters Foley 12" Silicone Coated	bx/100		\$ 9.30	ea	y	dynarex	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$7.47	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheters (Foley) Fr 5cc Silicone 14"	ea/1	cs/50	\$ 9.30	bx	y	dynarex	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$7.47	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheters (Foley) Fr 5cc Silicone 16"	bx/100		\$ 9.30	bx	y	dynarex	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$7.51	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheters (Foley) Fr 5cc Silicone 18"	bx/100		\$ 9.30	cs	n	dynarex	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$7.52	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheters (Foley) Fr 5cc Silicone 20"	cs/10		\$ 9.30	cs	y	dynarex	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$7.52	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheters (Foley) Fr 5 cc Silicone 22"	cs/10		\$ 9.30	cs	y	dynarex	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$7.52	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheters (Foley) Fr 5cc Silicone 24"	cs/10		\$ 9.30	cs	y	dynarex	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$8.58	cs	Yes	Medline						

Livingston County Health Department Bid Sheet for Medical Supplies
2016

Description	Buffalo Hospital						Medline						School Health					
	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand
Catheters (Foley) Fr 5cc Silicone 28"	cs/10		\$ 9.30	cs	y	dynarex	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$11.98	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheters (Foley)Fr 30 cc Silicone 20"	cs/10		\$ 9.30	cs	y	dynarex	10ea/cs	10ea/cs	\$16.95	cs	Yes	Medline						
Catheter procedure tray-foley insert tray (KDL76000)	cs/10		\$ 34.38	cs	y	medtronic	20ea/cs	20ea/cs	\$32.76	cs	Yes	Medline						
Cavacide wipes (standard size) MET-131100	cs/10		\$ 95.15	cs	n	metrex	1920ea/cs	1920ea/cs	\$96.16	cs	No	Metrex Research	220/can	12	\$11.40	Package		Aseptic Control
Coban Wrap 3" size (mmm1583)	cs/10		\$ 27.00	cs	y	dynarex	20ea/cs	20ea/cs	\$30.07	cs	Yes	Medline	1	24	\$2.07	Package	Yes	Hartmann Conco
Cervical Scraper (WHC)	cs/10		\$ 69.30	cs	y	dynarex	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Cloth Underpads (GCPPU343601L)	cs/20		\$ 7.19	ea	y	encompass	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Cloth Tape 1" rolls (Durapore)	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 0.75	ea	y	3m	144ea/cs	144ea/cs	\$59.73	cs	No		12 roll/box	10	\$21.24	Package	No	3M
Cloth Tape 2" rolls (Durapore)	ea/1	cs/24	\$ 1.50	ea	y	3m	144ea/cs	144ea/cs	\$59.73	cs	Yes							
Cloth Tape 3" roll (Durapore)	cs/5000		\$ 2.39	ea	y	3m	48ea/cs	48ea/cs	\$59.73	cs	No							
Clorox Wipes	pk/70	cs/6	\$ 10.20	pk	n	distributor sup	12cn/cs	12cn/cs	\$55.64	cs	Yes		75/can	6	\$7.57	Package		Clorox
Coban Tape (various sizes)	ea/1	cs/36	\$ 0.75	ea	y	dynarex												
Combine Pad 5x9	ea/1	cs/400	\$ 0.11	ea	y	dynarex	400ea/cs	400ea/cs	\$25.02	cs	Yes	Medline	20/pkg	20	\$4.26	Package	No	Dynarex
Condom Cath Med (external)	cs/100		\$ 172.86	cs	y	coloplast	25ea/cs	25ea/cs	\$6.99	cs	Yes	Medline						
Condom Cath Large (PDC7270)	bx/100		\$ 148.57	bx	y	coloplast	25ea/cs	25ea/cs	\$7.22	cs	Yes	Medline						
Condom Cath - Self Adhesive Large (MTR)							30ea/cs	30ea/cs	\$6.07	cs	No	Medline						
Cotton Balls, medium, bag	cs/4000		\$ 13.65	cs	n	medtronic	4000ea/cs	4000ea/cs	\$9.22	cs	No	Medline	500/bag	8	\$2.21	Package		Covidien
Cotton Tip Applicator 6" sterile	bx/200	cs/10	\$ 2.54	bx	pk/2	s2s global	2,000ea/cs	2,000ea/cs	\$18.83	cs	No	Medline	100/bag	10	\$2.47	Package		Dynarex
Cotton Tip Applicator 6" non-sterile	bx/1000	cs/100	\$ 4.35	bx	n	s2s global	10,000ea/cs	10,000ea/cs	\$29.20	cs	No	Medline	100/pkg	10	\$0.38	Package		SH Brand
Cover Slip, Glass	cs/10		\$ 202.91	cs	n	erie scientific	10ea/PK	10ea/PK	\$61.05	PK	No	Propper Mfg						
Derma Wound Cleanser	cs/12		\$ 35.52	cs	n	dermarite	6ea/cs	6ea/cs	\$12.91	cs	Yes	Medline						
Dermicel tape 1"	bx/24	cs/288	\$ 9.30	bx	y	dynarex	144ea/cs	144ea/cs	\$59.73	cs	No	Medline						
Dermicel tape 2"	bx/12	cs/144	\$ 9.30	bx	y	dynarex	72ea/cs	72ea/cs	\$59.73	cs	Yes	Medline						
Dermicel tape 3"	bx/6	cs/72	\$ 9.30	bx	y	dynarex	48ea/cs	48ea/cs	\$59.73	cs	No	Medline						
Diapers Adult extra large			see p 7				80ea/cs	80ea/cs	\$36.24	cs	No	Medline						
Diapers Adult large			see p 7				80ea/cs	80ea/cs	\$31.84	cs	Yes	Medline						
Diapers Adult medium			see p 7				80ea/cs	80ea/cs	\$30.76	cs	Yes	Medline						
Diapers Adult small			see p 7				80ea/cs	80ea/cs	\$28.60	cs	No	Medline						
Drainage Bag with reflux	ea/1	cs/20	\$ 28.00	cs	y	dynarex	20ea/cs	20ea/cs	\$39.40	cs	Yes	Medline						
Drainage Sponges, sterile 4 x 4	cs/300		\$ 44.20	cs	pk/2	dynarex	600ea/cs	600ea/cs	\$15.66	cs	No	Medline						
Drape Sheet, white 2 ply, 40 x 48	cs/100		\$ 15.00	cs	n	proadvantage	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$11.39	cs	No	Medline						
Dressing, Telfa 3" x 8"	bx/50	cs/600	\$ 9.03	bx	y	dynarex	600ea/cs	600ea/cs	\$39.40	cs	Yes	Medline						
Duo Derm, 4 x 4 thin (CVT187955)	bx/10	cs/300	\$ 53.40	bx	y	convatec	10ea/bx	10ea/bx	\$8.98	bx	Yes	Medline						
Duo Derm Sacral (CVT403332)	bx/5		\$ 45.06	bx	n	convatec	5ea/bx	5ea/bx	\$12.75	bx	Yes	Medline						
Econ Elastic Band (various Sizes)	bx/10	cs/50	\$ 6.07	bx	y	dynarex												
6"	bx/10	cs/50	\$ 8.80	bx	y	dynarex	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10/box		\$6.45	Package		SH Brand
3"	bx/10	cs/50	\$ 4.60	bx	y	dynarex	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10/box		\$3.29	Package		SH Brand

Livingston County Health Department Bid Sheet for Medical Supplies
2016

Description	Buffalo Hospital						Medline						School Health					
	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand
2"	bx/10	cs/50	\$ 3.20	bx	y	dynarex	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10/box		\$2.87	Package		SH Brand
Enema (plain & phosphate)	cs/48		\$ 41.60	cs	y	dynarex	24ea/cs	24ea/cs	\$14.02	cs	Yes	Medline						
Exam table paper, roll 18"w x 125'	cs/12		\$ 28.78	cs	y	proadvantage	12RL/cs	12RL/cs	\$16.02	cs	Yes	Medline	12/cs	12/cs	\$25.97	cs	No	Avalon Papers
Eye Wash	ea/1		\$ 1.90	ea	y	major	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$113.95	cs	No	Medline	4 oz/bottle	48/cs	\$2.29	Package		Medique
Face Shields (TID-F59605100)	bx/30	cs/120	\$ 48.46	bx	y	tidi	96ea/cs	96ea/cs	\$102.12	cs	Yes	Medline	10/box	5 box/cs	\$23.21	Package		SH Brand
Fit Test Supplies (solution/masks)	pk/1		\$ 244.60	pk	y	3m	1ea/ea	1ea/ea	\$140.52	ea	Yes	Medline						
Flashlights	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 24.00	cs	y	energizer	6ea/PK	6ea/PK	\$3.39	PK	Yes	Medline	1		\$7.96	Package		Five Star
Foam Cleanser (3 in 1)	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 36.35	cs	y	dermarite	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$31.15	cs	Yes	Medline						
Fracture Bed Pans Gold or Mauve	ea/1	cs/50	\$ 53.33	cs	y	medegen	24ea/cs	24ea/cs	\$16.19	cs	Yes	Medline						
Gauze sponge 2 x2 8 ply	pk/2	cs/3000	\$ 0.03	pk	pk/2	dynarex	3000ea/cs	3000ea/cs	\$32.72	cs	No	Medline	200/pkg	25 pkg/cs	\$1.62	Package		SH Brand
Foley leg straps (cath leg straps) (DAL316)	ea/1	bx/10	\$ 4.19	ea	y	dale	10ea/bx	10ea/bx	\$15.18	bx	Yes	Medline						
Gloves, Non-Sterile Latex - powdered																		
Small	cs/1000		\$ 53.35	cs	n	innovative	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$30.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$6.22	Package		Innovative
Medium	cs/1000		\$ 53.35	cs	n	innovative	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$30.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$6.22	Package		Innovative
Large	cs/1000		\$ 53.35	cs	n	innovative	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$30.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$6.22	Package		Innovative
X-large	cs/1000		\$ 53.35	cs	n	innovative	900ea/cs	900ea/cs	\$30.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$6.22	Package		Innovative
Gloves, Sterile pairs																		
Small	cs/200		\$ 65.00	cs	n	s2s global	200ea/cs	200ea/cs	\$61.22	cs	No	Medline						
Medium	cs/200		\$ 65.00	cs	n	s2s global	200ea/cs	200ea/cs	\$61.22	cs	Yes	Medline						
Large	cs/200		\$ 65.00	cs	n	s2s global	200ea/cs	200ea/cs	\$61.22	cs	No	Medline						
Gloves, Latex - powder free																		
Small	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 53.15	cs	n	s2s global	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$39.00	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$6.92	Package		Innovative
Medium	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 53.15	cs	n	s2s global	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$39.00	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$6.92	Package		Innovative
Large	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 53.15	cs	n	s2s global	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$39.00	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$6.92	Package		Innovative
X-large	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 53.15	cs	n	s2s global	900ea/cs	900ea/cs	\$39.00	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$6.92	Package		Innovative
Gloves, Vinyl - powdered																		
Small	cs/1000		\$ 38.36	cs	n	innovative	1500ea/cs	1500ea/cs	\$32.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$5.35	Package		Innovative
Medium	cs/1000		\$ 38.36	cs	n	innovative	1500ea/cs	1500ea/cs	\$32.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$5.35	Package		Innovative
Large	cs/1000		\$ 38.36	cs	n	innovative	1500ea/cs	1500ea/cs	\$32.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$5.35	Package		Innovative
X-large	cs/1000		\$ 38.36	cs	n	innovative	1300ea/cs	1300ea/cs	\$32.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$5.35	Package		Innovative
Gloves, Vinyl - powder free																		
Small	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 30.80	cs	n	s2s global	1500ea/cs	1500ea/cs	\$32.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$7.24	Package		SH Brand
Medium	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 30.80	cs	n	s2s global	1500ea/cs	1500ea/cs	\$32.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$7.24	Package		SH Brand
Large	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 30.80	cs	n	s2s global	1500ea/cs	1500ea/cs	\$32.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$7.24	Package		SH Brand
X-large	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 30.80	cs	n	s2s global	1300ea/cs	1300ea/cs	\$32.50	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$7.24	Package		SH Brand
Gloves, Latex free - powder free																		
Small	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 53.15	cs	n	s2s global	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$39.00	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$5.01	Package		Health Giant

Livingston County Health Department Bid Sheet for Medical Supplies
2016

Description	Buffalo Hospital						Medline						School Health					
	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand
Medium	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 53.15	cs	n	s2s global	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$39.00	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$5.01	Package		Health Giant
Large	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 53.15	cs	n	s2s global	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$39.00	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$5.01	Package		Health Giant
X-large	bx/100	cs/10	\$ 53.15	cs	n	s2s global	900ea/cs	900ea/cs	\$39.00	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$5.01	Package		Health Giant
Gloves, Nitrile Extended Cuff																		
Small	bx/50	cs/10	\$ 53.75	cs	n	s2s global	500ea/cs	500ea/cs	\$40.00	cs	No	Medline						
Medium	bx/50	cs/10	\$ 53.75	cs	n	s2s global	500ea/cs	500ea/cs	\$40.00	cs	No	Medline						
Large	bx/50	cs/10	\$ 53.75	cs	n	s2s global	500ea/cs	500ea/cs	\$40.00	cs	No	Medline						
X-large	bx/50	cs/10	\$ 53.75	cs	n	s2s global	500ea/cs	500ea/cs	\$40.00	cs	No	Medline						
Gloves, Nitrile																		
Small	bx/200	cs/10	\$ 87.50	cs	n	s2s global	1500ea/cs	1500ea/cs	\$59.03	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$4.23	Package		Health Giant
Medium	bx/200	cs/10	\$ 87.50	cs	n	s2s global	1500ea/cs	1500ea/cs	\$59.03	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$4.23	Package		Health Giant
Large	bx/200	cs/10	\$ 87.50	cs	n	s2s global	1500ea/cs	1500ea/cs	\$59.03	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$4.23	Package		Health Giant
X-large	bx/180	cs/10	\$ 87.50	cs	n	s2s global	1300ea/cs	1300ea/cs	\$59.03	cs	No	Medline	100/box	10 box/cs	\$4.23	Package		Health Giant
Glycerine Swabs, lemon (pouches)	bx/25	cs/10	\$ 31.35	cs	n	dynarex	750ea/cs	750ea/cs	\$21.67	cs	No	Medline						
Gowns, impervious	bx/15	cs/5	\$ 28.70	cs	n	s2s global	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$25.28	cs	No	Medline						
Gowns, standard size, 42" long (TID950343)	cs/50		\$ 38.49	cs	n	tidi	12ea/dz	12ea/dz	\$34.22	dz	No	Medline						
Gowns, extra large size, (TID910540)	cs/25		\$ 37.13	cs	n	tidi	1ea/ea	1ea/ea	\$8.70	ea	Yes	Medline						
Hydrogen Peroxide, 16 oz.	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 7.02	cs	y	proadvantage	12ea/bx	12ea/bx	\$4.96	bx	Yes	Medline	1	12/cs	\$0.78	Package		Swan
Hypafix Tape 2" 10 yds/roll	bx/1	cs/24	\$ 7.56	bx	y	smith-nephew	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$50.27	cs	No	Medline						
Hypafix Tape 4"	bx/1	cs/24	\$ 13.86	bx	y	smith-nephew	1ea/bx	1ea/bx	\$2.84	bx	No	Medline						
Ice packs - large 6 x 10	ea/1	cs/24	\$ 10.60	cs	y	dynarex	24ea/cs	24ea/cs	\$8.15	cs	Yes	Medline						
Ice packs - small 4 x 7	ea/1	cs/24	\$ 8.70	cs	y	dynarex	16ea/cs	16ea/cs	\$4.38	cs	Yes	Medline						
Incontinence Pads, 34"x26" (pink/quilted)	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 126.56	cs	y	hartmann	12ea/dz	12ea/dz	\$44.10	dz	Yes	Medline						
Irrigation Syringe - Cath. Tip (BD309664)	n-b						50ea/cs	50ea/cs	\$21.52	cs	Yes	Medline						
Irrigation Tray - bulb syringes (KDL67800)	ea/1	cs/20	\$ 25.80	cs	y	medtronic	20ea/cs	20ea/cs	\$17.84	cs	Yes	Medline						
Irrigation Tray with piston syringe	ea/1	cs/20	\$ 23.90	cs	y	medtronic	20ea/cs	20ea/cs	\$19.94	cs	Yes	Medline						
Kerlix Kling, Sterile 3" (KDL661300)	bx/12	cs/96	\$ 21.94	cs	n	dynarex	96ea/cs	96ea/cs	\$10.50	cs	Yes	Medline						
Kerlix Sterile 4 ½"	ea/1	cs/100	\$ 73.35	cs	y	dynarex	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	100/cs	\$2.12	Package		Kendall
Kerlix Super Sponge 4x4 (KDL2585)	bx/40	cs/240	\$ 12.15	bx	pk/2	medtronic	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$51.04	cs	No	Medline						
Kerlix Super Sponge 6x6	cs/480		\$ 97.87	cs	n	dynarex	480ea/cs	480ea/cs	\$34.15	cs	No	Medline						
Kling non-sterile, 2" 2ply (4yd rolls)	bg/12	cs/96	\$ 9.80	cs	n	dynarex	96ea/cs	96ea/cs	\$5.23	cs	Yes	Medline	12/pkg	8/cs	\$4.75	Package		Flexicon
Kling non-sterile, 3" 2ply (4yd rolls)	bg/12	cs/96	\$ 12.15	cs	n	dynarex	96ea/cs	96ea/cs	\$6.42	cs	Yes	Medline	12/pkg	8/cs	\$6.36	Package		Flexicon
Kling non-sterile, 4" 2ply (4yd rolls)	bg/12	cs/96	\$ 14.25	cs	n	dynarex	96ea/cs	96ea/cs	\$7.79	cs	Yes	Medline	12/pkg	8/cs	\$7.62	Package		Flexicon
Kling non-sterile, 6" 2ply (4yd rolls)	bg/6	cs/48	\$ 13.85	cs	n	dynarex	48ea/cs	48ea/cs	\$6.44	cs	No	Medline	6/pkg	8/cs	\$2.57	Package		Hartmann
Kling sterile 2" 2ply (4yd rolls)	bg/12	cs/96	\$ 20.15	cs	n	dynarex	96ea/cs	96ea/cs	\$8.22	cs	Yes	Medline	1 roll/pkg	96 roll/cs	\$0.71	Package		Flexicon
Kling sterile 3" 2ply (4yd rolls)	bx/12	cs/96	\$ 23.00	cs	n	dynarex	96ea/cs	96ea/cs	\$10.50	cs	Yes	Medline	1 roll/pkg	96 roll/cs	\$0.82	Package		Flexicon
Kling sterile 6" 2ply (4yd rolls)	bx/6	cs/48	\$ 28.70	cs	n	dynarex	48ea/cs	48ea/cs	\$10.42	cs	Yes	Medline	1 roll/pkg	48 roll/cs	\$0.75	Package		Hartmann
Labstix	n-b						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	100's		\$79.00	Package		Labstix

Livingston County Health Department Bid Sheet for Medical Supplies
2016

Description	Buffalo Hospital						Medline						School Health					
	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand
Lancets, various sizes (BD Microfine)	bx/100		\$ 17.35	bx	n	arkray	3600ea/cs	3600ea/cs	\$216.00	cs	No	Medline						
Lanoseptic Ointment (jars)	cs/24		\$ 92.80	cs	n	dynarex	24ea/cs	24ea/cs	\$74.07	cs	Yes	Medline						
Leg Bag various sizes KDL145514	ea/1	cvcs/50	\$ 85.18	cs	y	medtronic	48ea/cs	48ea/cs	\$22.52	cs	Yes	Medline						
Luer Lock plugs (red) SMM-MX49101	ea/1	cs/100	\$ 29.04	cs	y	smiths	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$27.68	cs	Yes	Medline						
Leg Straps (DAL316)	ea/1	bx/10	\$ 4.19	ea	y	dale	10ea/bx	10ea/bx	\$15.18	bx	Yes	Medline						
Masks N95 - Small	bx/35	cs/210	\$ 29.35	bx	y	halyard	240ea/cs	240ea/cs	\$88.77	cs	No	Medline	20/box	8 box/cs	\$27.64	Package		Moldex 1500
Masks N95 - Medium	cs/210		\$ 175.95	cs	n	halyard	240ea/cs	240ea/cs	\$88.77	cs	No	Medline	20/box	8 box/cs	\$27.64	Package		Moldex 1500
Masks N95 - Large	cs/210		\$ 175.95	cs	n	halyard	240ea/cs	240ea/cs	\$88.77	cs	No	Medline	20/box	8 box/cs	\$27.64	Package		Moldex 1500
Masks Surgical Tie On (3M)	bx/50	cs/600	\$ 11.20	bx	y	3m	300ea/cs	300ea/cs	\$20.55	cs	No	Medline						
Measuring tape, plastic 36"	n-b						6ea/bx	6ea/bx	\$2.36	bx	Yes	Medline						
Measuring tape, plastic 60"	ea/1		\$ 2.30	ea	y	adc corp	6ea/bx	6ea/bx	\$2.36	bx	Yes	Medline						
Medipore Tape 1"	cs/24		\$ 65.01	cs	n	3m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Medipore Tape 2"	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 65.01	cs	y	3m	12ea/bx	12ea/bx	\$37.80	bx	Yes	Medline						
Medipore Tape 3"	cs/12		\$ 97.20	cs	n	3m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Medipore Tape 4"	cs/12		\$ 130.00	cs	n	3m	12ea/bx	12ea/bx	\$32.72	bx	Yes	Medline						
Medipore Tape 6"	cs/12		\$ 194.36	cs	n	3m	12ea/bx	12ea/bx	\$47.70	bx	Yes	Medline						
Micropore Tape 1"	bx/12	cs/120	\$ 6.30	bx	y	3m	120ea/cs	120ea/cs	\$39.35	cs	Yes	Medline	12 roll/box	10 box/cs	\$13.36	Package		3M
Micropore Tape 2"	bx/6	cs/600	\$ 6.30	bx	y	3m	60ea/cs	60ea/cs	\$39.35	cs	Yes	Medline						
Microscope Slides 75x25	bx/72	cs/20	\$ 9.70	bx	n	erie scientific	1440ea/cs	1440ea/cs	\$184.52	cs	Yes	Azer Scientific						
Nasal Spray Mist (GLD613577)	ea/1	cs/24	\$ 27.10	cs	y	gericare	1ea/ea	1ea/ea	\$1.03	ea	Yes	Geri-Care Pharm						
Needle only 25 g 5/8" (BD305122)	bx/100	cs/1000	\$ 5.18	bx	n	b-d	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$91.13	cs	No	Becton Dickinson						
Needle only 22 g x 1	bx/100	cs/1000	\$ 5.18	bx	n	b-d	25ea/bx	25ea/bx	\$54.84	bx	No	Medline						
Needle only 20 g x 1	bx/100	cs/1000	\$ 5.00	bx	n	b-d	25ea/bx	25ea/bx	\$25.35	bx	No	Medline						
Needle 22G 1", 3cc syringe (BD)	bx/100	cs/800	\$ 11.66	bx	n	b-d	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Needle 22G 1", w/o syringe (BD)	bx/100	cs/1000	\$ 5.18	bx	n	b-d	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Needles 25G 1", 3cc syringe (BD)	bx/100	cs/800	\$ 11.66	bx	n	b-d	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Non-Sterile 2 x 2, 8 ply (sleeve)	pk/200	cs/5000	\$ 19.70	cs	n	dynarex	5000ea/cs	5000ea/cs	\$19.85	cs	No	Medline	200/pkg	25/cs	\$1.62	Package		SH Brand
Non-Sterile 4 x 4, 8 ply (sleeve)	pk/200	cs/4000	\$ 2.50	pk	n	dynarex	4000ea/cs	4000ea/cs	\$46.40	cs	No	Medline	200/pkg	20/cs	\$4.54	Package		SH Brand
Non-Sterile stretch gauze 3" (KDL2291)	bg/12	cs/96	\$ 12.15	cs	n	dynarex	96ea/cs	96ea/cs	\$6.42	cs	Yes	Medline	12/pkg	8/cs	\$2.09	Package		Hartmann
Normal Saline 1000cc (bottle) 1 litre	ea/1	cs/16	\$ 2.05	ea	y	b braun	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Normal Saline 500cc (bottle)	ea/1	cs/16	\$ 2.38	ea	y	b braun	18ea/cs	18ea/cs	\$31.00	cs	Yes	Medline						
Normal Saline 3 ounce (bottle) (KDL1020)	ea/1	cs/48	\$ 28.32	cs	y	nurse assist	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Paper Tape 1" (MMM1530/1)	bx/12	cs/120	\$ 6.30	bx	y	3m	120ea/cs	120ea/cs	\$39.35	cs	Yes	Medline	12 roll/box	10 box/cs	\$13.36	Package		3M
Paper Tape 2" (MMM1530/2)	bx/6	cs/600	\$ 6.30	bx	y	3m	60ea/cs	60ea/cs	\$39.35	cs	Yes	Medline						
Paper Tape 3" (MMM)	bx/40	cs/40	\$ 6.30	bx	y	3m	40ea/cs	40ea/cs	\$39.35	cs	Yes	Medline						
Paws Towellettes Ind Foil Packets ZAM34400	cs/1000		\$ 40.00	cs	n	safetec	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	100/box	10 box/cs	\$5.22	Package		Safetec
Penlites	ea/1	pk/6	\$ 7.25	pk	y	proadvantage	6ea/PK	6ea/PK	\$3.39	PK	Yes	Medline	6/pkg	50 pkg/cs	\$5.56	Package		B V Medical

Livingston County Health Department Bid Sheet for Medical Supplies
2016

Description	Buffalo Hospital						Medline						School Health					
	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand
Plastic Aprons (Bus)	ea/1	cs/144	\$ 43.86	cs	y	busse	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$36.76	cs	No	Medline						
Protoscopic Applicators 8"	bx/50	cs/500	\$ 3.67	bx	n	s2s global	500ea/cs	500ea/cs	\$16.02	cs	Yes	Medline						
Purell Handcleaner 4 oz squeeze tube	ea/1	cs/24	\$ 42.10	cs	y	gojo	24ea/cs	24ea/cs	\$20.56	cs	Yes	Medline	1	24/cs	\$2.56	Package		Purell
Reagent Strip (urinalysis) (Ames #2307)	n-b						100ea/BT	100ea/BT	\$9.64	BT	Yes	Medline	100/btl		\$14.36	Package		
Red Infectious Waste Bags 31 x 41, 1.1ml	ea/1	cs/100	\$ 24.96	cs	y	pitt	200ea/cs	200ea/cs	\$37.27	cs	No	Medline						
Resusi Face Shields (individually wrapped)	ea/1		\$ 6.80	ea	y	adc corp	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$28.06	cs	Yes	Medline	10/box	5/cs	\$23.21	Package		SH Brand
Sarna Lotion	n-b						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Scott C-fold Towels, 2 ply white	cs/2400		\$ 46.80	cs	n	kimberly	200ea/cs	200ea/cs	\$26.70	cs	No	Medline						
Seracults with mailing envelopes	bx/100		\$ 45.37	bx	n	propper mfr	80ea/cs	80ea/cs	\$149.05	cs	No	Propper Mfg						
Sharps Containers 1.5 (BD305487)	ea/1	cs/36	\$ 2.21	ea	y	b-d	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$51.29	cs	Yes	Medline						
Sharps Containers 1.4 qt (BD)	ea/1	cs/36	\$ 2.21	ea	y	b-d	100ea/cs	100ea/cs	\$51.29	cs	Yes	Medline						
Sharps Container 2 gal	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 5.12	ea	y	b-d	20ea/cs	20ea/cs	\$58.73	cs	Yes	Medline	1		\$9.52	Package		Pro-Tec
Sharps Containers 8.2 qt (BD)	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 5.12	ea	y	b-d	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$91.32	cs	Yes	Becton Dickinson						
Sharps Container 8 qt (BD)	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 5.12	ea	y	b-d	20ea/cs	20ea/cs	\$58.73	cs	Yes	Medline						
Sharps Container 5 gal (x-large) BD	ea/1	cs/8	\$ 9.44	ea	y	b-d	10ea/cs	10ea/cs	\$72.80	cs	No	Medline						
Sheepskin Heel pads	pr/2		\$ 17.35	pr	pr	skilcare	6ea/cs	6ea/cs	\$10.14	cs	Yes	Medline						
Sheepskin Rolls 30 x 60	ea/1		\$ 17.86	ea	y	skilcare	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Shower/Shampoo Caps	bx/200	cs/2000	\$ 8.95	bx	y	dukak	30ea/cs	30ea/cs	\$39.60	cs	Yes	Medline						
Soap, Liquid (Dial)	n-b						12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$16.78	cs	No	Medline	1 gallon	4 gallon/cs	\$18.30	Package		Dial
Speculum, Disposable, Large (Welch-Allyn)	bx/24	cs/96	\$ 45.19	bx	y	welch allyn	1ea/ea	1ea/ea	\$5.40	ea	Yes	Welch Allyn						
Speculum, Disposable, Medium (Welch-Allyn)	bx/24	cs/96	\$ 45.19	bx	y	welch allyn	72ea/cs	72ea/cs	\$208.17	cs	Yes	Welch Allyn	34/tube	250 tube/cs	\$1.48	Package		Welch Allyn
Speculum, Disposable, Small (Welch-Allyn)	bx/18	cs/72	\$ 55.39	bx	y	welch allyn	72ea/cs	72ea/cs	\$229.20	cs	Yes	Welch Allyn	34/tube	250 tube/cs	\$1.48	Package		Welch Allyn
Steri Strips 1/2" (#3MR1547)	bx/50	cs/200	\$ 72.00	bx	n	3m	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$90.35	cs	No	Medline	6/pkg	200 pkg/cs	\$2.18	Package		3M
Staple Removal Kits	ea/1	cs/50	\$ 0.94	ea	y	dynarex	50ea/cs	50ea/cs	\$37.19	cs	Yes	Medline						
Sterile Sponge 4 x 4	tr/25	cs/600	\$ 1.66	tr	pk/2	dynarex	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$20.27	cs	No	Medline						
Sterile Barriers 18" x 26" fenestrated	bx/50	cs/300	\$ 10.70	bx	y	dynarex	300ea/cs	300ea/cs	\$50.35	cs	No	Medline						
Sterile Barriers non-fenestrated	bx/50	cs/300	\$ 10.70	bx	y	dynarex	300ea/cs	300ea/cs	\$47.05	cs	Yes	Medline						
Sterile Dressing 2 x 2, 8 ply gauze	pk/2	cs/3000	\$ 0.03	pk	pk/2	dynarex	3000ea/cs	3000ea/cs	\$32.72	cs	No	Medline						
Sterile Dressing 4 x 4, 8 ply gauze	tr/25	cs/600	\$ 1.66	tr	pk/2	dynarex	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$32.00	cs	No	Medline						
Sterile Guaze 4 x4 12 ply	bx/25	cs/600	\$ 2.03	bx	pk/2	dynarex	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$37.48	cs	No	Medline	100/box		\$6.42	Package		SH Brand
Sterile Telfa 3 x 4 (ABC957303)	bx/100	cs/1200	\$ 6.50	bx	y	dynarex	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$46.12	cs	Yes	Medline	100/box	12 box/cs	\$7.91	Package		SH Brand
Sterile Topper 4 x 4	cs/600		\$ 57.35	cs	n	dynarex	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$35.20	cs	No	Medline	100/bag	20 bag/cs	\$7.09	Package		Dukak
Sterile 4x4 split quaze	tr/25	cs/300	\$ 3.69	tr	pk/2	dynarex	600ea/cs	600ea/cs	\$15.66	cs	No	Medline						
Sterile Water 1000cc	ea/1	cs/16	\$ 1.94	ea	y	b braun	10ea/cs	10ea/cs	\$23.98	cs	No	Teleflex Medical						
Stethoscopes various brands see Medline sheet	ea/1	cs/25	\$ 2.00	ea	y	s2s global							1		\$8.37	Package		SH Brand
Stretch Guaze 2" pkg & each	bg/12	cs/96	\$ 9.80	cs	n	dynarex	30bx/cs	30bx/cs	\$20.22	bx	No	Medline						
Stretch Guaze 4 x 4 pkg & each	bg/12	cs/96	\$ 14.25	cs	n	dynarex	12bx/cs	12bx/cs	\$20.27	bx	No	Medline						

Livingston County Health Department Bid Sheet for Medical Supplies
2016

Description	Buffalo Hospital						Medline						School Health					
	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand
CRX Stretch Gauze 3" NS (see Kling)	bg/12	cs/96	\$ 12.15	cs	n	dynarex	1RL/RL	1RL/RL	\$6.03	RL	Yes	Medline						
Surgilibe foil packets (FOU020545)	cs/864		\$ 55.35	cs	n	s2s global	600ea/cs	600ea/cs	\$29.76	cs	Yes	Medline						
Suture Sets	N-B						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Syringe 50cc	N-B						160ea/cs	160ea/cs	\$45.60	cs	Yes	Medline						
Syringe, disposable 10cc (BD 309604) w/out needle	bx/100	cs/400	\$ 12.01	bx	n	b-d	400ea/cs	400ea/cs	\$33.14	cs	Yes	Medline						
Syringe, disposable 5cc (BD 309603)	pk/125	cs/500	\$ 16.14	pk	n	b-d	400ea/cs	400ea/cs	\$24.07	cs	Yes	Medline						
Syringe, 1cc with needle (Tuberculin)	bx/100	cs/800	\$ 11.93	bx	n	b-d	500ea/cs	500ea/cs	\$75.84	cs	Yes	Medtronic USA	100/box	10 box/cs	\$17.67	Package		SH Brand
Syringe 1 cc w/out needle slip tip	bx/200	cs/1600	\$ 28.34	bx	n	b-d	2500ea/cs	2500ea/cs	\$86.81	cs	No	Medline						
Syringe 1 cc w/out needle luerlock	bx/100	cs/800	\$ 36.88	bx	n	b-d	800ea/cs	800ea/cs	\$34.95	cs	Yes	Medline						
Syringes 3 cc 25 g 5/8"	bx/100	cs/800	\$ 11.66	bx	n	b-d	800ea/cs	800ea/cs	\$46.76	cs	Yes	Medline						
Syringes 3 cc 25 g 5/8" safety glide	bx/100	cs/800	\$ 19.47	bx	n	b-d	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$210.79	cs	No	Medline						
Syringe, Rabies 3cc 22G 1", (BD #309572)	bx/100	cs/800	\$ 11.66	bx	n	b-d	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$210.79	cs	No	Medline						
Syringe, TB 25G 1cc 5/8" (BD #309626)	bx/100	cs/800	\$ 11.93	bx	n	b-d	500ea/cs	500ea/cs	\$59.69	cs	Yes	Ultimed Inc						
Tape, Hypafix 2" 10 yds/roll (see Hypafix)	bx/1	cs/24	\$ 7.56	bx	y	smith-nephew	1ea/bx	1ea/bx	\$1.60	bx	Yes	Medline						
Tegaderm, 2 3/8 - 2 3/4"	bx/100	cs/400	\$ 37.16	bx	y	3m	20ea/bx	20ea/bx	\$8.32	bx	Yes	Medline	100/box	4 box/cs	\$62.64	Package		3M
Tegaderm, 4 - 4 3/4" (10cm x 25cm)	bx/20	cs/80	\$ 44.75	bx	y	3m	10ea/cs	10ea/cs	\$11.14	cs	Yes	Medline	50/box	4 box/cs	\$103.21	Package		3M
Tegaderm Sacral	bx/6	cs/24	\$ 54.40	bx	y	3m	5ea/cs	5ea/cs	\$18.76	bx	Yes	Medline						
Telfa 3 x4	bx/100	cs/1200	\$ 6.50	bx	y	dynarex	1200ea/cs	1200ea/cs	\$46.12	cs	Yes	Medline	100/box	24 box/cs	\$14.45	Package		SH Brand
Thermometer kits (digital)	bx/25	cs/500	\$ 37.75	bx	y	s2s global	1ea/ea	1ea/ea	\$25.64	ea	Yes	Medline	1		\$6.70	Package		SH Brand
Thermometer Sheaths, digital	bg/25	cs/900	\$ 0.76	bg	n	s2s global	100ea/bx	100ea/bx	\$5.40	bx	No	Medline	100/box		\$3.01	Package		SH Brand
Tongue Blades Non - Sterile	bx/500	cs/5000	\$ 4.56	bx	n	s2s global	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$72.96	cs	No	Medline	500/box	10 box/cs	\$4.52	Package		Dynarex
Tongue Depressors - Sterile	bx/100	cs/1000	\$ 2.55	bx	n	s2s global	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$18.79	cs	Yes	Medline	100/box	100 box/cs	\$5.40	Package		SH Brand
Toothettes Mouth Moisturer tubes	n-b						36ea/cs	36ea/cs	\$221.29	cs	Yes	Glaxo Smithkline						
Toothettes - mint flavor	bx/250	cs/1000	\$ 23.18	bx	n	sage	500ea/cs	500ea/cs	\$34.31	cs	Yes	Medline	20/pkg		\$3.90	Package		Midwest
Toothettes - plain flavor (SAG5602UT)	bx/250	cs/1000	\$ 23.18	bx	n	sage	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$36.50	cs	Yes	Medline						
Towelettes (BZK)	bx/100	cs/1000	\$ 18.00	cs	n	dynarex	1000ea/cs	1000ea/cs	\$14.40	cs	No	Medline	100's	20 box/cs	\$3.88	Package		PDI
Triple Antibiotic Packets	bx/144	cs/1728	\$ 13.65	bx	n	dynarex	900ea/cs	900ea/cs	\$102.76	cs	No	Unifirst First Aid	144/box		\$16.78	Package		Water Jel
Triple Care EPC Cream	n-b						12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$26.46	cs	Yes	Medline						
Tuberculicide Spray	n-b						12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$51.67	cs	Yes	Sealed Air						
Tubigrip (various sizes) <i>see Medline various sizes</i>			see attached															
Ultrasonic Transmission Gel, 8 2oz (Parker)	ea/1	cs/12	\$ 11.35	cs	y	s2s global	12ea/cs	12ea/cs	\$7.26	cs	Yes	Medline						
Underpads 17 2 x 24 small	cs/300		\$ 26.42	cs	n	dynarex	300ea/cs	300ea/cs	\$16.79	cs	No	Medline	300/cs	cs	\$62.46	cs	No	Medline
Underpads 23 x 24 medium	cs/200		\$ 25.71	cs	n	dynarex	150ea/cs	150ea/cs	\$20.02	cs	Yes	Medline	200/cs	cs	\$53.31	cs	No	Medline
Underpads 23 x 36 large	cs/150		\$ 26.07	cs	n	dynarex	75ea/cs	75ea/cs	\$19.84	cs	No	Medline	150/cs	cs	\$39.63	cs	No	Medline
Urinals (Male)	ea/1	cs/50	\$ 0.49	ea	y	medegen	48ea/cs	48ea/cs	\$19.80	cs	Yes	Medline						
Urine Specimen Containers (sterile)	ea/1	cs/100	\$ 0.15	ea	y	amsino	400ea/cs	400ea/cs	\$66.57	cs	Yes	Medline						
Urintex Tubes	n-b						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						

Livingston County Health Department Bid Sheet for Medical Supplies
2016

Description	Buffalo Hospital						Medline						School Health					
	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand	Quantity per package	Packages per cs	Bid Price	per package or per cs?	Order by each?	Brand
Uristic 4, Glucose/Nitrate/Protein/Lucosites (Ames)	n-b						No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
Vaseline Guaze 3 x9 each & box	bx/50	cs/200	\$ 37.80	bx	n	medtronic	200ea/cs	200ea/cs	\$71.83	ea	Yes	Medline						
Waffle Cusions (EHOB)	ea/1		\$ 27.87	ea	y	skilcare	1ea/ea	1ea/ea	\$19.00	ea	Yes	EHOB						
Xeroform Guaze 1 x 8	bx/50	cs/200	\$ 41.32	bx	n	medtronic	200ea/cs	200ea/cs	\$66.51	cs	Yes	Medline						
Xeroform Gauze 4 x 3	bx/6	cs/36	\$ 39.70	bx	n	medtronic	36ea/cs	36ea/cs	\$116.60	cs	Yes	Medline						
Xeroform Guaze 4 x 4	bx/25	cs/150	\$ 30.46	bx	n	medtronic	150ea/cs	150ea/cs	\$73.47	cs	Yes	Medline						
Xeroform Guaze 5 x 9	bx/50	cs/200	\$ 73.19	bx	n	medtronic	200ea/cs	200ea/cs	\$105.77	cs	Yes	Medline						