

BID FORM FOR CLEANING AND PAPER PRODUCTS

Note: The case size should include the number of rolls, gallons, packages, etc. Please be sure to include the brand of the product.

VENDORS #1	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE						Hill & Marques			Economy Products		Regional Distributors		W.B. Mason		Buffalo Paper & Twine		State Industrial Products		Central Poly	
ITEM DESCRIPTION	Estimated Annual Totals	Informational Use Only <i>Estimated to be ordered by each Department</i>				CURRENT CASE SIZE	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BRAND OF PROPOSED PRODUCT	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.
		OFA	Jail	CS	HW																
Air Freshener, fan cartridge style, Citrus or Cherry (Impact 30 day)	10		10			6/cs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.91	6/cs				\$17.27	6/case		\$66.15	12 x 4oz cups		
Air Freshener, Gel 2 oz. (Refresh 2.0 Cherry)	11				11	12/box	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$31.76	12/bx				\$17.27	12/case					
Bags, Grocery AJM 25#	2	2				100/bundle	\$4.260	Sold 500/CS Only @	DURO	\$23.56	500	\$21.87	500/BNDL		\$20.88	500/bundle					
Bag, Kraft #10 LB. (large brown paper lunch bags)	4	4				500/bundle	\$12.550	500/BL	DURO	\$15.86	500	\$14.32	500/BNDL		\$11.63	500/bundle					
Bleach (Pure Bright)	28	8	15	5		6/1gal	\$9.240	6/GLS/CS	BOARDWALK	\$8.79	6	\$8.42	6/1GAL	\$9.89	6-1 GALCT	\$9.88	6gal/case				
Bowl, foam, 12 oz	13	3	10			1000/cs	\$14.250	1000/CS	GENPAK	\$15.70	1000	\$17.30	1000/CASE	\$15.43	1000/CT	\$16.65	1000/case				
Bowl, foam, 4-5 oz	14	14				1000/cs	\$16.750	1000/CS	GENPAK	\$14.05	1000	\$14.16	1000/CASE	\$13.73	1000/CT	\$14.40	1000/case				
Broom, large angle	12		12			12/cs	\$40.080	12/CS	OCDAR	\$5.99	ea	\$47.04	12/CASE		\$5.97	each					
Cleaner, Degreaser, Aerosol 20 oz. cans	3		3			12/cs	\$19.950	12/32OZ/CS-QTS. NOT	SIMONIZ	\$19.34	12x20	\$31.48	12/15OZ		\$26.00	12/case	\$163.80	#125861-12 STATE 999 CITRUS 12 x 12			
Cleaner, Disinfectant, Aerosol foaming, 20 oz.	1			1		12/cs	\$20.150	12/190Z/CS	CLAIRE	\$10.73	12x20	\$25.27	12/18OZ		\$20.84	12/case	\$16,830	#117548 FIX 12 x 18 OZ CANS			
Cleaner, Industrial Drain Digest Enzyme	2			2		4 / 1 gal	\$26.000	4/GLS/CS	SIMONIZ	\$26.13	4x1	\$142.24	4/1GAL		\$29.26	4gal/case	\$148.50	#123174 PRIMEZYME 4			
Cleaner, Glass, 20 oz. spray cans (One Swipe)	4			4		12/case	\$20.150	12/190Z/CS	CLAIRE	\$19.73	12x20	\$24.14	12/20OZ		\$20.72	12/case	\$120.60	#126257-12 READYCLEAN GLASS			
Cleaner, Oven and Grill	2		2			12/cs	\$29.300	12/QTS/CS	AMERICO GEN	\$22.43	12x20	\$30.64	12/18OZ		\$25.21	12/case	\$135.90	DEGREEZ OVEN			
Cleaner, Stainless Steel, Aerosol 20 oz. Cans	6		6			12/cs	\$23.700	SOLD 12/140Z/CS	CLAIRE	\$23.00	12x20	\$33.36	12/18OZ		\$2,738	12/case	\$157.50	#121782-12 SSC			
Cleaner, Toilet Bowl, High Acid, quarts (Simoniz)	1	1				12/cs	\$19.200	12/QTS/CS	SIMONIZ	\$18.99	12x32	\$21.14	12QT/CASE		\$16.25	12/qts/case	\$194A0	#121159 MINT ACTION			
Cleanser, All Purpose Neutral (AP-7), Germicidal	8	8				4/ gal cs	\$16.500	4/GLS/CS	SIMONIZ	\$16.90	4x1	\$26.94	4/1GAL		\$29.56	4gal/case	\$141.30	#121173 F-236 SCENTED TERG.O.CIDE			
Cleanser, Scouring Powder, 14 oz. (Babo)	2	2				24/cs	\$17.850	24/210Z/CS	BABO	\$16.89	24	\$16.23	24/21OZ		\$15.92	24/2lozcans/case					
Clorox Clean-up, 9/32 oz	1	1				9/cs	\$29.750	9/32OZ/CS	CLOROX	\$22.00	Sep-32	\$36.18	9/32OZ		\$28.75	9/qts/case					
Cups, 8 oz hot/cold with handles	10			10		1000/cs	\$46.000	1000/CS	DART SOLO	\$69.90	1000			\$42.24	1000/CT	\$46.37	1000/case				
Cups, foam, 12 oz.	2				2	1000/cs	\$30.450	1000/CS	DART	\$26.75	1000	\$30.42	1000/CASE	\$27.94	1000/CT	\$29.30	1000/case				
Cups, foam, 8 oz.	40		40			1000/cs	\$21.400	1000/CS	DART	\$18.73	1000	\$21.44	1000/CASE	\$19.69	1000/CT	\$20.65	1000/case				
Cups, foam, 6 oz.	15	15				2500/cs	\$45.625	SOLD 1000/CS ONLY @	DART	\$16.10	1000	\$18.32	1000/CASE	\$16.83	1000/CT	\$17.62	1000/case				
Cup Lids for 8 oz hot/cold	17		15	2		1000/cs	\$13.800	1000/CS	DART	\$20.08	1000	\$13.87	1000/CASE	\$12.73	1000/CT	\$13.35	1000/case				
Cups, translucent plastic, 5oz	2	2				2500/cs	\$28.500	2500/CS	FABRIKAL	\$30.39	2500	\$33.69	2500/CASE	\$30.59	2500/CT	\$32.10	2500/case				
Dish Detergent, (Emerald Green / Dawn)	35	5	30			4 gal/cs	\$18.750	4/GLS/CS	SIMONIZ	\$17.04	4x1	\$15.89	4/1GAL	\$20.54	4-1 GAL/CT	\$24.73	4gal/case	\$130.50	GLO PROFESSIONA		
Dust Mop Frame, snap on 48" x 5"	3		3			each	\$7.750	EACH	TUWAY	\$3.99	ea	\$6.95	EACH		\$4.00	each					
Dust Mop, cotton, 48" x 5"	6		6			5/cs	\$35.000	Sold 3/CS Only @ \$21.00/CS	TUWAY	\$6.99	ea	\$81.82	12/CASE		\$6.95	each					
Facial Tissue, 2-ply (Kleenex)	1				1	30 box/cs	\$12.750	30/100/CS	CASCADES	\$10.78	30/100	\$12.48	30/100/CASE		\$15.90	30/case			\$13.99	30 Boxes/Case	
Floor machine pads: polish 20" white	30		30			5/cs	\$11.950	5/CS	AMERICO GEN	\$10.99	5/cs	\$19.38	5/CASE	\$10.15	5/CT	\$11.88	5/case				
Floor machine pads: primer 20" red	20		20			5/cs	\$11.950	5/CS	AMERICO GEN	\$10.99	5/cs	\$19.38	5/CASE	\$10.15	5/CT	\$11.88	5/case				
Floor machine pads: stripper 20" black	20		20			5 gal	\$11.950	5/CS	AMERICO GEN	\$10.99	5/cs	\$19.94	5/CASE	\$10.15	5/CT	\$11.88	5/case				
Floor polish, high solids, high traffic, high gloss	8		8			5 gal	\$49.000	5 GLS	SIMONIZ	\$49.93	5 gal	\$82.82	5GAL PAIL	\$72.56	5-GAL PAIL	\$50.22	5gal/pail	\$170.10	SPARKLE DIAMOND		
Floor wax stripper, heavy duty	3		3				\$30.500	5 GLS	SIMONIZ	\$38.90	5 gal	\$78.48	5GAL PAIL	\$64.28	5-GAL PAIL	\$51.10	5gal/pail	\$75.60	#106211 MIGHTY SPARKLE		
Foil tray with lids (cardboard w/foil underside)	50	50				250/cs	\$46.875	SOLD 200/CS ONLY @	PACTIV	\$37.74	250	\$66.63	250/CASE		\$50.15	250/case					

VENDORS #1	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE						Hill & Markes			Economy Products		Regional Distributors		W.B. Mason		Buffalo Paper & Twine		State Industrial Products		Central Poly			
ITEM DESCRIPTION	Estimated Annual Totals	Informational Use Only <i>Estimated to be ordered by each Department</i>				CURRENT CASE SIZE	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BRAND OF PROPOSED PRODUCT	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.
		OFA	Jail	CS	HW																		
Foil, aluminum, 18"x500', heavy duty	16	12	4		1 rl/cs	\$18.850	500'/RL	WESTERN	\$17.60	rl	\$15.68	18"X500' ROLL		\$15.60	roll				\$25.38	1	Roll		
Gloves, Latex, size M, powder free	6			6	100/bx	\$3.500	SOLD 10/100/CS ONLY @	FOODHANDLER	\$3.40	100/bx	\$4.04	100/BOX	\$2.58	100/BX, 10 BX/C	\$29.25	10bx/100/case			\$4.23	100/Box			
Gloves, Latex, size L, powder free	8			8	100/bx	\$3.500	SOLD 10/100/CS ONLY @	FOODHANDLER	\$3.40	100/bx	\$4.04	100/BOX	\$2.58	100/BX, 10 BX/C	\$29.25	10bx/100/case			\$4.23	100/Box			
Gloves, Latex, size XL, powder free, "kitchen use"	30		30		100bag/10cs	\$3.500	SOLD 10/100/CS ONLY @	FOODHANDLER	\$3.40	100/bx	\$4.04	100/BOX	\$25.80	100/BX, 10 BX/C	\$29.25	10bx/100/case			\$42.25	10/100/Case			
Gloves, Vinyl, size M, powder free, "kitchen use"	24	6	18		1,000/cs	\$22.000	10/100/CS	FOODHANDLER	\$21.11	1000/cs	\$21.40	10/100/CASE	\$22.60	100/BX	\$20.25	10bx/100/case			\$28.44	1000/Case			
Gloves, Vinyl, size L, powder free, "kitchen use"	4	4			1,000/cs	\$22.000	10/100/CS	FOODHANDLER	\$21.11	1000/cs	\$21.40	10/100/CASE	\$22.60	100/BX	\$20.25	10bx/100/case			\$28.44	1000/Case			
Gloves, Vinyl, size XL, powder free, "kitchen use"	30	5	25		1,000/cs	\$22.000	10/100/CS	FOODHANDLER	\$21.11	1000/cs	\$21.40	10/100/CASE	\$22.60	100/BX	\$20.25	10bx/100/case			\$28.44	1000/Case			
Hairnets, light brown	1		1		144/cs	\$9.500	144/BX	KEYSTONE	\$1562.900	1 1/4'x4'x0'x0'x	\$10.48	144/BOX		\$10.10	144/bx								
Hand Sanitizer Cartridges, AntibactGel, Alcohol Free (Aquacil Foaming)	2			2	6/1000 ML	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			\$51.84	6/1000ML		\$42.30	6/1000mil/case		\$144.00	GENTLE FRESH SANITIZER					
Hand Sanitizer Cartridges, Antibacterial Gel, Alcohol Free (Enopac)	21		20	1	12/800 ML	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$39.96	12/800	\$26.05	4/750ML		\$35.00	12/800mil/case								
Hand Sanitizer (Dermagel Grn Sanitiz)	4	4			gal	\$8.750	SOLD 4/GLS/CS ONLY @	KUTOL	\$1232".289	gal	\$60.94	4/1GAL		\$15.00	4gal/case, \$60.00								
Hand soap cartridges, enriched lotion	26		5	21	12/800 ML	\$41.000	12/800ML/CS	KUTOL		800	\$30.38	12/800ML		\$21.99	12/800mil/case								
Hand soap cartridges, Foaming Blue Hand Wash (Inopak)	3			3	6/1000 ML	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$40.82	6/1000	\$44.65	6/1000ML		\$35.00	6/1000mil/case		\$119.70	#122288 GENTLE FRESH 1000ML					
Hand soap, liquid, enriched lotion	15	2	8	4	4 gal/cs	\$15.500	4/GLS/CS	SIMONIZ	\$18.99	4x1	\$18.44	4/1GAL		\$20.00	4gal/case		\$127.80	#122360 HANDS ON					
Hand soap cartridges, pumice	4			4	4/2000 ML	\$57.000	4/2000ML/CS	GOJO	\$56.46	Apr-00	\$59.36	4/2000ML		\$50.88	4/2000mil/case		\$87.30	INDUSTRIAL HAND					
Laundry Soap	2			2	50 lb/box	\$22.500	50#/CS	SIMONIZ	\$22.57	50 lb	\$26.47	50# PAIL		\$18.43	401b/pail								
Lime Scale Remover	12		12		4/16 oz	\$23.000	SOLD 4/GLS/CS ONLY @	SIMONIZ	\$23.79	4x1	\$39.82	4/1GAL		\$85.00	12/28oz/case @ \$8								
Mop Handle, for mop head below	53	3	50		each	\$3.590	SOLD 12/CS ONLY @	TUWAY	\$2.99	ea	\$5.09	EACH		\$4.50	each								
Mop Head, lay flat, 20 oz. (must screw into handle)	615		615		each	\$4.160	SOLD 12/CS ONLY @	TUWAY	\$4.74	ea	\$3.92	EACH		\$3.12	4/case @ \$12.48								
Mop Head, medium weight	6	6			1 each	\$2.750	SOLD 3/CS ONLY @ \$8.25/CS	TUWAY	\$4.57	ea	\$3.58	EACH		\$2.00	12/case @ \$24.00								
Napkins, white paper fold 1/4, 1 ply	11	10		1	6000/cs	\$22.750	6000/CS	MORCON	\$21.25	6000	\$22.16	6000/CASE		\$23.95	6/500ct/case								
Paper Towels, (Bay West #314) white roll, 8 x 800'	70			70	6/cs	\$36.150	6/800'/CS	SCA ESSITY	\$34.70	6/cs	\$39.55	6 ROLLS/CASE		\$17.75	6/case				\$28.70	6/Case			
Paper Towels, C-Fold	24		24			\$12.750	2400/CS	CASCADES	\$11.90	2400	\$14.72	2400/CASE	\$11.53	2400/CT	\$12.10	2400/case			\$14.30	2400/Case			
Paper Towels, rolled, brown, 8" wide x 350', 2" core	22		12		10 12/cs	\$12.950	12/350'/CS	CASCADES	\$12.80	12/cs	\$13.28	12/CASE	\$13.41	12/CT	\$12.40	12/case			\$14.70	12/Case			
Paper Towels, square brown single-fold hand towels, 9.25x10.25	5			5	4,000/cs	\$12.950	4000/CS	CASCADES	\$13.90	4,000	\$15.24	4000/CASE	\$13.17	4008/CT	\$15.25	4000/case			\$14.66	4008/Case			
Paper Towels, White Multi-fold	155			150	5 4000/cs	\$13.750	4000/CS	CASCADES	\$13.99	4000	\$17.08	4000/CASE	\$13.87	4000/CT	\$15.80	4000/case			\$14.67	4000/Case			
Paper Towels, white roll, 70 sheets per roll	598	8	550	30	10 30 rl/cs	\$15.450	30/85/CS	CASCADES	\$14.49	30/cs 86 shts/r;	\$14.15	30/CASE	\$13.93	30/CT	\$17.65	30/85ct/case			\$14.99	30/Case			
Plastic Wrap, 18"x2000'	12	4	8		1 rl/cs	\$12.500	2000'/RL	ANCHOR	\$14.81	rl	\$13.56	18"X2000' ROLL		\$12.88	roll				\$14.30	1 Roll			
Plate, foam, 9" - 3 compartment, white, laminated surface	45	45			500/cs	\$14.750	500/CS	GENPAK	\$14.05	500	\$22.67	500/CASE	\$20.82	500/CT	\$22.10	500/case							
Plate, paper, white 6", uncoated	12	12			500/cs	\$4.875	SOLD 1000/CS ONLY @ \$	ASPEN	\$10.29	1000	\$10.80	10/100/CASE	\$11.83	1000/CT	\$11.16	10/100ct/case							
Plates, styrofoam 10"	13		12	1	500/cs	\$30.000	500/CS	GENPAK	\$15.75	500	\$27.09	500/CASE	\$24.88	500/CT	\$26.25	500/case							
PVC Film, 18' x 2000'	4	4				\$12.500	2000'/RL	ANCHOR	\$14.81	rl	\$13.56	18"X2000' ROLL		\$12.88	roll				\$13.99	1 Roll			
Rags, white cotton t-shirt	12			12	25#/bx	\$30.000	25#/CS	HOSPECO	\$32.50	25 lbs	\$40.12	25#/CASE		\$28.50	251b/case								
Sanitary Napkin Dispenser liners, wall mount units	4			4	500/cs	\$12.250	500/CS	HOSPECO	\$12.99	500	\$16.14	500/CASE		\$12.10	500/case								

VENDORS #1	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE						Hill & Markes			Economy Products		Regional Distributors		W.B. Mason		Buffalo Paper & Twine		State Industrial Products		Central Poly			
ITEM DESCRIPTION	Estimated Annual Totals	Informational Use Only <i>Estimated to be ordered by each Department</i>				CURRENT CASE SIZE	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BRAND OF PROPOSED PRODUCT	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.	BID PRICE	PROPOSED PACKAGE SIZE # PER CASE, ETC.
		OFA	Jail	CS	HW																		
Sanitary Napkins	1			1	250/cs	\$25.000	250/CS	HOSPECO	\$26.30	250	\$40.58	250/CASE			\$24.30	250/case							
Scouring Pad, green 6 x 9	5		5		10/pk	\$2.000	SOLD 6/10/CS ONLY @ \$	DISCO	\$2.99	10 pk	\$2.58	10/PACK			\$4.40	20/box							
Scouring Pad, green 3 x 4.5	4	4			10/pk	\$2.000	SOLD 6/10/CS ONLY @ \$	DISCO	\$2.75	ea.	\$2.58	10/PACK			\$12.10	20/case							
Sponge, all purpose with scour back	36	6	24	3	3	5/pk	\$2.875	\$23.00/CS	DISCO	\$4.35	5/pk			\$21.64	20/CASE			\$12.10	20/case				
Sponges, all purpose	12	12				5/pk	\$4.600	SOLD 48/CS ONLY @ \$	DISCO	\$6.25	5/pk	\$4.90	5/PACK (\$0.98/EACH)		\$28.00	24/case							
Spray Buff (flooring)	20		20			gal	\$6.750	SOLD 4/GLS/CS ONLY @	SIMONIZ	\$28.99	4x1	\$40.48	4/1GAL		\$32.00	12/quarts/case	\$183.60	#102871 SPRAY BUFF 18 pints per case					
Swiffer Duster Handle	4			4			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.88	ea.	\$48.14	6 KITS/CASE each kit includes		\$7.75	1 kit							
Swiffer Duster Refills	10			10			\$30.000	6/4/CS	P&G	\$37.65	cs	\$30.12	4/6/CASE		\$29.20	4/10pack/case							
Tampons	1			1		500/cs	\$51.000	500/CS	HOSPECO	\$49.00	500/cs	\$52.94	500/CASE		\$52.80	500/case							
Toilet tissue, 2 ply roll, 500 sheets	441	1	300	130	10	96 rls/cs	\$24.750	96/500/CS	CASCADES	\$24.44	96	\$27.16	96/CASE	\$23.35	96/CT	\$26.98	96ct/case			\$27.30	96/Case		
Trash Liner, hi-molecular (Mobil 36"x60", 56 gal)	50		50			200/cs	\$25.300	200/CS	HERITAGE	\$14.54	200	\$20.42	200/CASE		\$19.75	100/case				\$21.10	200/Case		
Trash Liners, 10 micron, clear, 30x37	20		20			500/cs	\$19.250	500/CS	ALUF	\$15.56	500	\$15.58	500/CASE	\$15.47	10 MIC, NATURAL,	\$17.60	500/case			\$18.00	500/Case		
Trash Liners, 14 micron, clear, 43x48	52		50		2	500/cs	\$49.625	SOLD 200/CS ONLY @	ALUF	\$15.37	500	\$15.94	200/CASE	\$16.03	14 MIC, NATURAL,	\$21.10	200/case			\$20.00	500/Case		
Trash Liners, 16 micron, clear, 33 gal., 33x40	102		20	80	2	500/cs	\$36.700	SOLD 250/CS ONLY @ \$	ALUF	\$14.23	500	\$14.42	250/CASE	\$14.73	16 MIC, NATURAL,	\$16.92	250/case			\$27.50	500/Case		
Trash Liners, 16 micron, clear, 60 gal., 38x60	35	12		23		200/cs	\$26.850	200/CS	ALUF	\$20.68	200	\$20.42	200/CASE	\$17.22	14 MIC, NATURAL,	\$23.33	200/case			\$23.80	200/Case		
Trash Liners, 16 micron, clear, 56 gal., 43x48	40			40		200/cs	\$22.950	200/CS	ALUF	\$18.59	200	\$17.75	200/CASE	\$17.85	16 MIC, NATURAL,	\$24.60	200/case			\$24.00	200/Case		
Trash Liners, 3 ply super tuff, black, 55 gal., 38x58	20			17	3	100/cs	\$23.350	100/CS	ALUF	\$17.69	100	\$20.62	100/CASE		\$26.88	100/case				\$21.00	100/Case		
Trash Liners, 8 micron, clear, 12-16 gal., 24x33	47			45	2	1000/cs	\$22.950	1000/CS	ALUF	\$17.21	1000	\$18.38	1000/CASE	\$19.73	8 MIC, CLR, 1000/CT	\$23.30	1000/case			\$19.00	1000/Case		
Trash Liners, 8 micron, clear, 7-10 gal., 24x24	40			40		1000/cs	\$16.750	1000/CS	ALUF	\$13.51	1000	\$13.08	1000/CASE	\$14.38	8 MIC, CLR, 1000/CT	\$17.05	1000/case			\$13.00	1000/Case		
Trash Liners, Blue, 1.2 mil thick, 22x16x58 (Aluf Plastics Blue Recycling)	10			10		100/CS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.52	100	\$36.83	100/CASE		\$44.00	200/case				\$27.00	100/Case		
Windshield Cleaner	3	3				6 gal/cs	\$15.300	6/GLS/CS	CROWN	\$13.99	6/cs	\$14.48	6/1GAL		\$12.95	6gal/case							
Wipes, handi-wipe, 100/box	4	4				100/bx	\$6.500	SOLD 200/CS ONLY @	CHICOPEE	\$16.70	250	\$33.48	12/100/CASE		\$16.92	200/case							
Ziplock bags, gallon	40	5	35			250 box	\$8.000	SOLD 200/CS ONLY @ \$32.00/CS	FOODHANDLER	\$16.90	250	\$13.58	250/CASE		\$12.76	250/box							
Ziplock bags, quart	3	3				500 box	\$10.000	SOLD 200/CS ONLY @ \$20.00/CS	FOODHANDLER	\$15.37	500	\$13.58	500/CASE		\$12.76	500/box							